AGENDA

REGULAR VILLAGE BOARD MEETING

MARCH 14, 2023
7:00 PM

1. CALL TO ORDER
2. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
INVOCATION (PASTOR STEFAN POTUZNIK, CHRISTUS VICTOR LUTHERAN CHURCH)
3. APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF FEBRUARY 28, 2023
4. MAYOR & BOARD OF TRUSTEES' REPORT

5. ACCOUNTS PAYABLE WARRANT: FEBRUARY 28,2023 $3,008,244.05
MARCH 14, 2023 $ 317,560.30

6. CONSENT AGENDA

a. Consideration to award a professional service contract to Ayers Associates Inc. of
Madison, WI for aerial orthophotography and planimetric mapping updates as part of the
GIS Consortium purchasing agreement in the amount of $33,680 from the Water & Sewer
Fund.

(Elk Grove Village has been a member of the GIS Consortium since 2008.

(The GIS Consortium (GISC) is a group of local communities that have worked together
to develop a cost-effective solution for implementing geographic information systems
(GIS) and related technologies.

(One of those cost-effective solutions is to purchase aerial photography/mapping in bulk
through the Consortium’s 41 municipalities.

(The GIS Consortium Board of Directors appointed a Base Mapping Committee to initiate
a selection process for a photogrammetric mapping consultant, and Ayers Associates was
the selected vendor.

(As part of the pricing agreement, Ayers Associates uses economies of scale to provide
their services at a reduced price.

(As part of this year’s mapping program, Ayers Associates will produce updated aerial

Page 1 of 5



imagery of the Village and perform planimetric imagery updates within the Elk Grove
Village community.
(The Public Works Director recommends approval.)

. Consideration of the following:

e To cancel the purchase contract with Chastang Ford of Houston, TX for the
purchase of two (2) Ford F-150 Responder Trucks in the amount of $97,890, as
agreed to by Chastang Ford, due to a delay in production of these vehicles; and

e To waive the formal bidding process and award a purchase contract to Wickstrom
Ford of Barrington, IL for the purchase of two (2) Ford F-150 Responder Trucks
in the amount of $96,925.52 from the Foreign Fire and Capital Replacement
Funds.

(On August 17, 2022, the Village Board awarded a purchase contract to Chastang Ford of
Houston, Texas, for the purchase of two (2) Ford F-150 Responder Trucks in the amount
of $97,890.

(Chastang Ford has been unable to provide vehicles to the Village due to a delay in
production.

(Chastang Ford has agreed to cancel the awarded purchase contract, with no financial
consideration, due to being unable to provide the vehicles in a timely manner.

(Wickstrom Ford of Barrington, IL, has two (2) F-150 Responders Trucks currently
available on their lot for the total amount of $96,925.52

(Sufficient funds are available in the Foreign Fire and Capital Replacement Funds.

(The Director of Public Works recommends approval.)

. Consideration to increase the professional service contract with Nicholas & Associates,
Inc. of Mount Prospect, IL, for the rehabilitation of the Clock Tower and Veterans
Memorial Park in the amount of $149,441.83 for a total cost of $1,904,349.43 from the
Residential Enhancement Fund.

(On September 14, 2021, the Village Board approved the professional service contract
with Nicholas & Associates, Inc. of Mount Prospect, IL, to perform a professional service
contract to act as construction manager and administration of trade packages for the
rehabilitation of the Clock Tower and Veterans Memorial Park for a total amount not to
exceed $1,754,908.

(An increase of $149,441.83 is requested for a change order that includes fountain
modifications, additional landscape improvements, requested overtime, and granite stone
cleaning and sealing of the existing water wall.

(Adequate funds are available in the Residential Enhancement Fund.

(The Director of Public Works recommends approval.)

. Consideration of a request to renew the services contract with Sebert Landscaping of Elk
Grove Village, IL for the Parkway Restoration - Sod contract in the amount of
$207,402.30 from the General Fund and Water & Sewer Fund.

(On May 11, 2021, the Village Board awarded a contract to Sebert Landscaping of Elk
Grove Village, IL for the Parkway Restoration - Sod contract.

(The contract provided for an option of four (4) additional renewals through February 28,
2026.

Page 2 of 5



(Sebert Landscaping performed satisfactorily throughout the first two years of the
contract.

(The contract period is from March 1, 2023 through February 28, 2024.

(The contract amount reflects a 5% increase over the previous year's contract.

(The Director of Public Works recommends approval.)

. Consideration to award a professional service contract to Baxter & Woodman Natural
Resources, LLC of Crystal Lake, IL, for the Business Park Ditch Maintenance Program in
the amount of $250,000 from the Business Leader Fund.

(A proposal for professional design-build services was solicited from Baxter & Woodman
Natural Resources, LLC of Crystal Lake, IL, for analysis, vegetation management,
engineering, permitting, and construction to manage the Village’s Business Park ditch
system.

(Baxter & Woodman Natural Resources has successfully assisted several other
Municipalities in the Chicagoland area with similar projects.

(Adequate funds are available in the Business Leader Fund.

(The Director of Public Works recommends approval.)

Consideration to approve the second quarter financial report ending October 31, 2022.

(As part of the financial software system, staff has created quarterly financial reports
comparing year to date numbers to the prior year.)
(The Director of Finance recommends approval.)

. Consideration to adopt Ordinance No. 3801 amending Title 8, Chapter 3C of the Building
Activity Code of the Village of Elk Grove Village.

(This Ordinance formally adopts the 2023 National Electrical Code (NEC) for use by the
Village. Additionally, the adoption includes minor amendments and/or deletions deemed
necessary to address conditions specific to Elk Grove Village.

(International and National Codes provide standardized regulations which are adopted by
local governments for application within their communities.

(The Director of Community Development recommends approval.)

. Consideration to adopt Ordinance No. 3802 amending Title 8, Chapter 12B, Section 1-2,
Subsections A- B, Required Improvements of the Land Subdivision Code of the Village
of Elk Grove Village.

(This Ordinance amends sections of the Required Improvements for Land Subdivision of
the Village to formally adopt and reflect the requirements as set forth in the Cook County
Watershed Management Ordinance and the DuPage County Countywide Stormwater and
Floodplain Ordinance for use by the Village.

(The Ordinance will provide standardized stormwater management regulations which are
adopted by local governments for application within their communities.

(The Director of Community Development recommends approval.)

Consideration to adopt Ordinance No. 3803 granting a variation of Section 3-7:D(3) of
the Zoning Ordinance to permit the construction of a six-foot (6') high fence extending
approximately five (5') feet beyond the nearest front corner of the principal structure on
the adjacent single-family residential lot to the south at 102 Ridgewood Road for property
located at 209 Oakton Street, Elk Grove Village.

Page 3 of 5



(This item was discussed at the February 28, 2023 Village Board Meeting and currently
appears under Unfinished Business.)

j. Consideration to adopt Ordinance No. 3804 approving Jurisdictional Transfer between the
Illinois Department of Transportation and the Village of Elk Grove Village.

(This ordinance enters into an agreement for transfer of jurisdiction of Midway Court
from N00'42'01"W, South and East of the east edge of pavement to adjust to Busse Road
in its entirety, to the Village.)

k. Consideration to adopt Resolution No. 8-23 approving the Plat of Subdivision identified
as 1000 Oakton Street Plat of Consolidation (201 Innovation Drive and 1000 Oakton
Street).

(This proposed Subdivision would consolidate two (2) existing lots at 201 Innovation
Drive and 1000 Oakton Street into one (1) lot for the purpose of consolidating the parcels
to develop a substation that will provide electricity for the adjacent data center facilities.
(Village staff recommends approval.)

7. REGULAR AGENDA

8. PLAN COMMISSION - Village Manager Roan

a. Consideration of a petition submitted by the Village of Elk Grove to consider text
amendments to the Elk Grove Village Zoning Ordinance as it pertains to Self-Storage
Facilities. (PH 03-20-2023)

b. Consideration of a petition submitted by Riverpoint Property Trust, LLC for Rezoning
from I-2 to I-1 for property located at 751 Pratt Boulevard.
(A Public Hearing date is yet to be established.)

9. ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS - Village Manager Roan

10. RECYCLING & WASTE COMMITTEE - Trustee Franke

a. Sustainability Plan
11. JUDICIARY, PLANNING AND ZONING COMMITTEE - Trustee Prochno
12. CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS COMMITTEE - Trustee Schmidt
13. CABLE TELEVISION COMMITTEE - Trustee Lissner
14. YOUTH COMMITTEE - Trustee Franke
15. INFORMATION COMMITTEE - Trustee Miller
16. BUSINESS LEADERS FORUMS - Trustee Schmidt
17. HEALTH & COMMUNITY SERVICES - Trustee Prochno

18. PERSONNEL COMMITTEE - Trustee Franke

Page 4 of 5



19. AIRPORT UPDATE - Mayor Johnson

20. PARADE COMMITTEE - Mayor Johnson

21. MID-SUMMER CLASSICS CONCERT SERIES UPDATE - Mayor Johnson
22.SPECIAL EVENTS COMMITTEE - Mayor Johnson

23. LIQUOR COMMISSION - Mayor Johnson

24. REPORT FROM VILLAGE MANAGER

25. REPORT FROM VILLAGE CLERK

26. UNFINISHED BUSINESS

a. Village Attorney - Direct the Village Attorney to prepare the necessary documents for a
fence variation at 209 Oakton Street.

27. NEW BUSINESS
28. PUBLIC COMMENT

29. ADJOURNMENT

In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act and other applicable Federal and
State laws, the meeting will be accessible to individuals with disabilities. Persons requiring
auxiliary aids and/or services should contact the Village Clerk, preferably no later than five
days before the meeting.

Page 5 of 5



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING TITLE 8, CHAPTER 3C OF THE BUILDING
ACTIVITY CODE OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE VILLAGE OF ELK GROVE

VILLAGE

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and Board of Trustees of the Village
of Elk Grove Village, Counties of Cook and DuPage, Illinois, as follows:

Section 1:
A.

That 8-3C-1 be amended to read as follows:

Code Adopted. There is hereby adopted by reference, as if fully set out
herein, the most current published edition of that certain code known as
NFPA 70, the National Electrical Code as sponsored and published by the
National Fire Protection Association, together with the additions,
insertions, deletions and changes hereinafter set forth, one (1) copy which
is available for inspection and on file in the office of the Village Clerk.

In the event of a conflict between the provisions of this Article and the
provisions of the most current published edition of NFPA 70, the National
Electrical Code, the provisions contained in this Article shall prevail and
the conflicting provisions contained in NFPA 70, the National Electrical
Code, shall be of no force and effect.

Amendments. The following additions, insertions, deletions and changes
are hereby made to NFPA 70, the National Electrical Code:

1. Section 210.8(F) GFCI Protection for Outdoor Outlets shall be
amended by deleting Exception No. 2 for listed residential HVAC
equipment.

2. Section 230.70(A)(1) Readily Accessible Location shall be
amended as follows:

230.70(A)(1) Readily Accessible Location. Add the following text
to the end of the sentence: "and within five feet (5') of the point of
entrance of the service conductors."

3. Section 310.3(B) Conductor material shall be amended to read as
follows:

310.3(B) Conductor Material. Conductors in this Article shall be of
copper material only. No other type of material may be used for
conductors.

4. Section 320.10 Uses Permitted shall be amended to read as
follows:

Section 320.10 Uses Permitted. Type AC cable shall only be
permitted when used to supply light fixtures or -electrical
equipment in lengths not exceeding six feet (6') in accessible
spaces or twelve feet (12') in concealed spaces.

1



10.

11.

12.

Section 330.10 Uses permitted shall be amended to read as
follows:

Section 330.10 Uses Permitted. Type MC cable shall only be
permitted when used to supply light fixtures or -electrical
equipment in lengths not exceeding six feet (6’) in accessible
spaces or twelve feet (12”) in concealed spaces.

Section 334.10 Uses Permitted shall be amended to read as
follows:

334.10 Uses Permitted. Type NM and Type NMC cables are not
permitted to be used within the Village.

Section 348.10 Uses Permitted shall be amended to read as
follows:

Section 348.10 Uses Permitted. Type FMC flexible metal conduit
shall only be permitted when used to supply light fixtures or
electrical equipment in lengths not exceeding six feet (6') in
accessible spaces or twelve feet (12') in concealed spaces.

Section 350.10 Uses Permitted shall be amended to read as
follows:

Section 350.10 Uses Permitted. Type LFMC liquidtight flexible
metal conduit shall only be permitted when used to supply light
fixtures or electrical equipment in lengths not exceeding six feet
(6") in accessible spaces or twelve feet (12') in concealed spaces.

Section 352.10 Uses permitted for PVC conduit is hereby amended
by deleting paragraph (G) Exposed.

Section 356.10 Uses Permitted shall be amended to read as
follows:

Section 356.10 Uses Permitted. Type LFNC liquidtight flexible
non-metallic conduit shall only be permitted when used to supply
light fixtures or electrical equipment in lengths not exceeding six
feet (6') in accessible spaces or twelve feet (12') in concealed
spaces.

Section 360.10 Uses Permitted shall be amended to read as
follows:

Section 360.10 Uses Permitted. Type FMT flexible metallic tubing
shall only be permitted when used to supply light fixtures or
electrical equipment in lengths not exceeding six feet (6') in
accessible spaces or twelve feet (12') in concealed spaces.

Section 362.10 Uses Permitted shall be amended to read as
follows:

Section 362.10 Type ENT Electrical Nonmetallic Tubing is not
permitted to be used within the Village.



Section 2:
pamphlet form.

Section 3:

13.

Section 400.10 Uses Permitted, paragraph (A) Uses, sub-
paragraph (1) Pendants is hereby amended to read as follows:

Pendants. Pendant hung flexible cable and cord is prohibited.

Exception: Pendant hung flexible cable may be permitted only
with the written permission of the Director of Community
Development and only under circumstances where the use of
flexible cord as a wiring method is necessary to the method of
operation due to the frequent alteration, change or relocation of
electrical equipment. Such permission shall be granted only upon
evaluation of written documentation submitted to the Director of
Community Development that clearly demonstrates exceptional
practical hardship as distinguished from a mere inconvenience to
the owner or tenant. All pendant hung flexible cable approved
under this section shall contain a ground conductor and shall be
terminated in approved fittings.

That the Village Clerk is hereby authorized to publish this Ordinance in

That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its

passage, approval and publication according to law.

ATTEST:

PASSED this

VOTE: AYES: NAYS: ABSENT:
day of 2023
APPROVED this day of 2023
APPROVED:

Mayor Craig B. Johnson
Village of Elk Grove Village

Loretta M. Murphy, Village Clerk

PUBLISHED this

day of , 2023 in pamphlet form.




ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING SECTIONS A AND B OF SECTION 8-12-1-B OF THE
OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE VILLAGE OF ELK GROVE VILLAGE

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and Board of Trustees of the Village
of Elk Grove Village, Counties of Cook and DuPage, Illinois, as follows:

Section 1: That 8-12B-1-2: REQUIRED IMPROVEMENTS be amended to read as
follows:

A. Storm and Surface Water Runoff:

1. Storm Drains: An adequate system of storm water drainage designed for a 10-year return
frequency rain shall be constructed and installed, consisting of pipes, tiles, manholes, inlets and
other necessary facilities that will adequately drain the subdivision and protect roadway
pavements and will prevent the accumulation of storm water at any place under normal
conditions. Open ditches shall be prohibited in all residential zoning areas. Back yard swales are
permitted in residential zoning areas subject to the following regulations:

a. Maximum and minimum slopes and general design criteria of the Federal Housing
Administration and the Department of Housing and Urban Development's "Minimum Property
Requirements" will be acceptable except as herein modified.

b. No continuous swale shall have a length exceeding six hundred feet (600"). (Ord. 1054,
4-13-76)

¢. Minimum grade of the flow line shall be one percent (1%). (Ord. 1697, 2-12-85)

d. At no point in the swale shall the flow line be more than three feet (3') below the
finished grade of the topsoil at the foundation of the house opposite the swale.

e. No change in alignment of a back yard swale shall exceed forty five degrees (45°).

2. Open Ditches: Open ditches are allowed for rear yard drainage in the industrial and
commercial zoning areas if they conform to the following regulations:

a. The bottom of the ditch shall be lined with a five inch (5") thick concrete invert
minimum of three feet (3'-0") wide. Two (2) number 6 reinforcing rods are to be equally spaced
for the entire length of the invert.

b. The grade of the invert shall be designed to provide a velocity of flow between three
feet (3') and five feet (5') per second.

c. The sides of the ditch shall not exceed a two to one (2:1) slope.
d. All side slopes shall be sodded from the invert to the top of the slope.

e. Any alignment change shall require concrete slope protection on the side slopes of the
ditch or other erosion control measure as approved by the Director of Community Development.



B. Storm Water Management:

1. The Watershed Management Ordinance (WMO) as adopted by the Metropolitan Water
Reclamation District of Greater Chicago (MWRD) on May 1, 2014 and as subsequently
amended, and the DuPage County Countywide Stormwater And Floodplain Ordinance adopted
September 24, 1991 and as subsequently amended shall govern the design of any improvement
with respect to storm water management within Cook County and DuPage County respectively
in addition to the following:

a. Streets, blocks, depths of lots, parks and other public grounds shall be located and laid
out in such a manner as to preserve and utilize natural streams, channels and detention basins
including, wherever possible, the larger streams and flood plains within parks or other public
grounds.

b. Storm water from a 100-year return frequency storm must be stored and/or transported
from any development in such a manner that no damage results from flooding.

c. A combination of storage and controlled release of storm water runoff is required for all
non-residential developments, regardless of size, and for residential developments exceeding five
(5) acres in area.

d. The release rate of storm water from all developments requiring detention shall not
exceed the storm water runoff rate from the area in its natural undeveloped state.

Because of the flat conditions of the land in this area, channel configurations cut by nature are
generally unable to handle the runoff from high intensity rainfalls and results in flood plain
storage or spreading of runoff over the land areas during the larger storm periods. In order not to
increase the runoff from such areas after development, the release rate must be limited to the
carrying capacity of these natural channels.

In no instance shall a release rate greater than two tenths cubic feet per second (0.2 cfs) be used.

e. Drainage systems shall have adequate capacity to bypass through the development the
flow from all upstream areas for a storm of design frequency assuming that the land is in a fully
developed state under present zoning or zoning proposed under a Comprehensive Plan. The
bypass flow rate shall be computed utilizing a runoff coefficient of not less than 0.35. An
allowance will be made for upstream detention when such upstream detention and release rate
has been approved by the Director of Community Development and that evidence of its
construction can be shown.

f. The live detention storage to be provided will be calculated on the basis of the 100-year
frequency rainfall as published by the Illinois State Water Survey, Bulletin 75, for this area and
as subsequently amended. The detention volume required will be that necessary to handle the
runoff of a 100-year rainfall, for any and all durations, from the fully developed drainage area
tributary to the reservoir, less that volume discharged during the same duration at the approved
release rate.

g. Sharply meandering streams or channels may be partly straightened and minor changes
made in other channels, subject to approval of the Director of Community Development;



provided the floodway dimensions of the stream or channel are maintained, and the volume of
flood water storage outside the floodway is not reduced.

h. The smaller uppermost reaches of drainage channels and swales forming the natural
drainage system near the watershed divide may be relocated or eliminated and incorporated into
the planned system of storm sewers upon a showing that the system is adequate and can safely
handle the flood water runoff following the heavier rain storms.

1. Storm sewer outfalls shall be so designed, by reason of elevation of the invert that,
when the receiving stream is in full flood, the storm sewer will continue to drain the area it is
designed to serve at a uniform rate.

j. Cross-sections and grades of streets designed as channels shall be designed to
temporarily store and convey the overflow from storm sewers and over-the-curb runoff and be
provided with adequate outlets for safe disposal of such overflow. The street cross-section shall
provide a lot grade for the finished floor of each adjoining building at least two feet (2') higher
than the crown of the pavement, and the minimum sill elevation of openings in the outer walls of
such buildings shall be at least two and one-half feet (2.5') above the crown elevation.

k. The crown of street pavements hereafter built adjoining or near streams, flood water
runoff channels or detention basins shall be not lower than the established high-water elevation
plus two feet (2'), in the case of major streets, and plus one foot (1') in a 100-year frequency
storm.

1. Waterway openings of bridges and culverts hereafter built over streams of flood water
runoff channels shall be designed with a waterway opening large enough to handle the flow from
a 100-year frequency storm.

m. Construction, filling or other similar physical occupation of the flood plain as defined
by the Department of the Interior United States Geological Survey, which is otherwise prohibited
by this subsection, may be permitted if adequate compensatory storage volume is provided. This
shall be accomplished by developing in the existing flood plain excavated space below the high-
water elevation in an amount equal to the flood storage capacity preempted by the proposed
construction. In the case of streams and channels, such excavation shall be made opposite or
immediately upstream from the area to be filled. It shall be the duty of the property owner to
conduct such excavation in a manner consistent with the other provisions of this subsection and
may be done only after the approval by the Director of Community Development has been
granted. Approval of the Director of Community Development will be contingent upon the
property owner's ability to demonstrate that the compensatory storage will be adequate and
satisfactory for its intended purpose.

2. Drainage Plan: A comprehensive drainage plan must be submitted to the Director of
Community Development which incorporates the aforementioned rules and shall provide or be
accompanied by maps or other descriptive material showing the following:

a. The extent and area of each watershed tributary to the drainage channels in the
subdivision.



b. The street storm sewers and other storm drains to be built, the basis of their design, the
outfall and outlet locations and elevations, receiving stream or channel and its high-water
elevation and the functioning of the drains during high-water conditions.

c. The parts of the proposed street system where pavements are planned to be depressed
sufficiently to convey or temporarily store overflow from storm sewers and over-the-curb runoff
resulting from the heavier rain storms and the outlets for such overflow.

d. Existing streams and flood water runoff channels to be maintained, enlarged, altered
otherwise and eliminated and new channels to be constructed, their locations, cross-sections and
profiles.

e. Existing culverts and bridges, drainage areas, elevation and adequacy of waterway
openings and new culverts and bridges to be built, their materials, elevations, waterway openings
and basis of design.

f. Existing detention ponds and basins to be maintained, enlarged, altered otherwise and
new ponds or basins to be built with dams and their design.

3. Construction Requirements for Detention Ponds:
a. Detention Ponds Containing Permanent Water:

(1) Detention reservoirs containing permanent water must have a water area of at least
one-half (!/,) acre and a minimum depth of approximately ten feet (10') over at least twenty five
percent (25%) of the total area. The remaining lake area must have an average depth of at least
five feet (5') and should have no extensive shallow areas.

(2) In excavated lakes, the underwater side slopes in the lakes must be stable. In the case
of valley storage, natural slopes may be considered to be stable.

(3) A safety ledge four feet (4') to six feet (6') in width is required and must be installed
in all lakes approximately thirty inches (30") to thirty six inches (36") below the permanent water
level. In addition, a ledge twelve inches (12") to eighteen inches (18") above the permanent
water line must be provided. The slope between the two (2) ledges must be stable and of a
material which will prevent erosion due to wave action such as stone or rip rap.

(4) A safety ramp exit from the lake is required in all cases and should have a minimum
width of twenty feet (20'") and exit slope of six horizontal to one vertical (6:1). The ramp must be
of a material that will prevent its deterioration due to vehicle use and/or wave action.

(5) Periodic maintenance is required in lakes to control weed and larval growth. The
reservoir must also be designed to provide for the easy removal of sediment which will
accumulate in the lake during periods of reservoir operation. A means of maintaining the
designed water level of the lake during prolonged periods of dry weather is also required. One
suggested method is to have a water hydrant near the pond site.

b. Detention Ponds Containing Permanent Water and Dry Detention Ponds:

(1) All excavated spoils must be spread so as to provide for aesthetic and recreational
features such as sledding hills, sport fields, etc. Slopes of six horizontal to one vertical (6:1) are



required except where recreation uses call for steeper slopes. Even these features must have a
slope no greater than three horizontal to one vertical (3:1) for safety, minimal erosion, stability
and ease of maintenance.

(2) Safety screens must be provided for any pipe or opening to prevent children or large
animals from crawling into the structures. A maximum opening of six inches (6") is required.

(3) In valley storage reservoirs, an emergency spillway or other provision must be
provided to allow for bypassing flood flows during periods when the design capacity of the
reservoir and outlet has been exceeded. This spillway must be of such a design that its operation
is automatic and does not require manual attention.

(4) Sod or other suitable vegetative cover as approved by the Director of Community
Development must be provided throughout the entire reservoir area.

(5) Debris and trash removal and other necessary maintenance must be performed after
each storm to assure continued operation in conformance to the design.

c. Dry Detention Ponds:

(1) Dry detention ponds must have an underdrain system to minimize the wetness of the
bottom so that water does not remain standing in the bottom thereby harboring insects and
limiting the potential use of the reservoir. The underdrain system could empty by gravity into the
wet well of a pump station or to the receiving stream directly.

(2) The dry detention pond must be designed to serve multi-purpose functions.
Recreational facilities, aesthetic qualities, etc., as well as flood water storage must be considered
in planning the reservoir.

4. Responsibility for Maintenance of Detention Ponds:

a. The responsibility for maintenance during construction and thereafter shall be the
responsibility of the land developer/ owner.

b. Storm water detention and retention basins may be donated to the Village or other unit
of government designated by the Village for ownership and permanent maintenance, providing:

(1) The facility has been designed and constructed according to Village requirements
enumerated above;

(2) All improvements have been constructed, approved and accepted by the Village for
the land area served by the drainage basin;

(3) Detention ponds containing permanent water are located within a tract of land
consisting of fifteen (15) acres or more, of which thirty percent (30%) of the area is above the
high-water line, and includes a body of water of ten (10) surface acres or more, of which fifty
percent (50%) is to have a minimum depth of ten feet (10'); four inch (4") size rip rap to be
provided three feet (3') below and three feet (3') above normal water line; all slopes between the
rip rap and high-water line are to be sodded and the remaining land area is to be hydroseeded; are
equipped with electrically-driven aeration devices to maintain proper aerobic conditions to
sustain aquatic life; have a four foot (4') wide crushed limestone walkway at the high water line



entirely around the body of water; are situated to permit public access two hundred feet (200')
wide and not less than two hundred feet (200") to the high-water line; and providing further, that
the high-water line is not closer than thirty five feet (35") to any property line.

(4) Dry detention ponds are located on a tract of land consisting of two (2) acres or more
of land, including a minimum bottom area of two hundred seventy five feet by two hundred
seventy five feet (275'x 275") or two hundred feet by three hundred seventy five feet (200'x 375");
maximum side slopes of five to one (5:1); all slopes are to be sodded to the high-water line; the
bottom of the basin and areas above the high-water line are to be hydroseeded; and providing
further, that the high-water line is not closer than thirty five feet (35') to any property line. (Ord.
1054, 4-13-76; 1992 Code)

Section 2: That the Village Clerk is hereby authorized to publish this Ordinance in
pamphlet form.

Section 3: That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its
passage, approval and publication according to law.

VOTE: AYES: NAYS: ABSENT:

PASSED this day of 2023

APPROVED this day of 2023
APPROVED:

Mayor Craig B. Johnson
Village of Elk Grove Village
ATTEST:

Loretta M. Murphy, Village Clerk

PUBLISHED this day of , 2023 in pamphlet form.




ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE GRANTING A VARIATION OF SECTION 3-7:D (3) OF THE ZONING
ORDINANCE TO PERMIT THE CONSTRUCTION OF A SIX-FOOT (6') HIGH FENCE
EXTENDING APPROXIMATELY FIVE (5°) FEET BEYOND THE NEAREST FRONT
CORNER OF THE PRINCIPAL STRUCTURE ON THE ADJACENT SINGLE-FAMILY
RESIDENTIAL LOT TO THE SOUTH AT 102 RIDGEWOOD ROAD FOR PROPERTY
LOCATED AT 209 OAKTON STREET, ELK GROVE VILLAGE

WHEREAS, the Zoning Board of Appeals of the Village of Elk Grove Village, at a public
meeting duly called and held according to law, considered the question of granting a variation of
Section 3-7:D (3) of the Zoning Ordinance to permit the construction of a six-foot (6') high fence
extending approximately five (5’) feet beyond the nearest front corner of the principal structure on the
adjacent single-family residential lot to the South at 102 Ridgewood Road east for property located at
209 Oakton Street, Elk Grove Village, and

WHEREAS, the Mayor and Board of Trustees of the Village of Elk Grove Village, after
having considered the recommendation and finding of said Zoning Board of Appeals, find and believe
that sufficient hardship exists so as to justify the finding of said variation.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED, by the Mayor and Board of Trustees of the
Village of Elk Grove Village, Counties of Cook and DuPage, Illinois as follows:

Section 1: That there be granted a variation of Section 3-7:D (3) of the Zoning Ordinance to
permit a six-foot (6') high fence extending approximately five (5°) feet beyond the nearest front corner
of the principal structure on the adjacent single-family residential lot to the South at 102 Ridgewood
Road. The fence will replace an existing six (6°) foot high wood fence at 209 Oakton Street, Elk
Grove Village.

Section 2: That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage and

approval according to law.

VOTE: AYES: NAYS: ABSENT:

PASSED this day of 2023

APPROVED this day of 2023
APPROVED:

Mayor Craig B. Johnson
Village of Elk Grove Village
ATTEST:

Loretta M. Murphy, Village Clerk



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE APPROVING JURISDICTIONAL TRANSFER BETWEEN THE
ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION AND THE VILLAGE OF ELK
GROVE VILLAGE

WHEREAS, the Village of Elk Grove Village (“VILLAGE”), Cook and DuPage
Counties, Illinois, and the State of Illinois (“STATE”), through its Department of
Transportation, seek to enter into a jurisdictional transfer of Midway Court (IDOT key Route
016 06011 001735) from the STATE to the VILLAGE. A location map identifying the limits

of the jurisdictional transfer is attached hereto as Exhibit #1; and

WHEREAS, the transfer of jurisdiction of Midway Court is from N00'42'01"W, south
and east to the east edge of pavement adjacent to Busse Road in its entirety, to the VILLAGE;

and

WHEREAS, the Mayor and Board of Trustees find and declare that it is in the best
interests of the VILLAGE to approve the Jurisdictional Transfer attached hereto and made a
part hereof.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and Board of Trustees of the
Village of Elk Grove Village, counties of Cook and DuPage, Illinois that Midway Court be
added to the municipal street system, as follows:

Section 1: The recitals set forth hereinabove shall be and are hereby incorporated as
findings of fact as if said recitals were fully set forth herein.

Section 2: The Jurisdictional Transfer attached hereto shall be, and is hereby approved.

Section 3: This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after it passage and

approval in the manner provided by law.

Section 4: All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith shall be and the

same are hereby repealed.

Section 5: The Village Clerk of the Village of EIk Grove Village shall certify to the



adoption of this ordinance and cause the same to be published in pamphlet form.

VOTE: AYES: NAYS: ABSENT:

PASSED this day of 2023

APPROVED this day of 2023
APPROVED:

Mayor Craig B. Johnson
Village of Elk Grove Village
ATTEST:

Loretta M. Murphy, Village Clerk

PUBLISHED in pamphlet form this day of January 2023.



_ Exhibit 1
Location Map
Jurisdictional Transfer
STATE OF ILLINOIS TO VILLAGE OF ELK GROVE VILLAGE

MIDWAY COURT
Key Route 016 06011 001735
Mile Stationing Sta 0.00 to 0.30

From N0O0'42'01"W, south and east
to the east edge of pavement adjacent to Busse Rd

OAKTON ST

o0/

Extent of jurisdictional transfer

v

MID
WAy or

(a)
o
Ll
95}
(2]
2
o

m

5

()

9

=2

[0p)

5

(72)
0 150 300 600

I S cct




01/17/2023

TO: Matthew Roan, Village Manager
FROM: Caroline Gabiga, Assistant Village Manager
SUBJECT: Plat of Subdivision identified as 1000 Oakton Street (201

Innovation Drive and 1000 Oakton).

BACKGROUND:

The Village has received a petition from Webster, McGrath, & Ahlberg, LTD, on behalf of
Microsoft Corporation to consolidate 1000 Oakton Street and 201 Innovation Drive from
one (1) lot into two (2) lots. The purpose of the petition is to consolidate the parcels into a
single lot to develop a substation that will provide electricity for the Microsoft data center
facilities. The Petitioner is aware that they will be required to apply for a Special Use Permit for the
electric substation before they can begin construction of the proposed substation.

The petition was reviewed by the Departments of Public Works, Community Development,
Fire, and Police. The consensus of Village Staff is to recommend approval of the petition.

One-lot subdivisions must be approved by the Village Board, based on a recommendation
by Village Staff. In the past, staff reviews were provided to the JPZ Committee prior to
being placed on a Village Board agenda. At the November 19, 2019 meeting, the JPZ
Committee voted to send staff recommendations on one-lot resubdivisions for commercial
and industrial properties directly to the Village Board for approval.

APPROVALS:

Caroline Gabiga Created/Initiated
Caroline Gabiga Approved
Maggie Jablonski Approved

Lorrie Murphy Final Approval
ATTACHMENTS:

1. PlatofSubdivision, Microsoft
2. Image_20230222_0001

Page1of1



RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION APPROVING A PLAT OF SUBDIVISION IDENTIFIED AS 1000
OAKTON PLAT OF CONSOLIDATION (MICROSOFT)

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Board of Trustees of the
Village of ElIk Grove Village, Counties of Cook and DuPage, State of Illinois as follows:

Section 1: That approval is hereby given the Plat of Subdivision identified as 1000
Oakton Plat of Consolidation of part of the southeast quarter of Section 12, Township 41 North,
Range 11, east of the third principal meridian, in Cook County, Illinois, a copy of which is
attached hereto and made a part hereof as if fully set forth.

Section 2: That the Mayor and Village Clerk are hereby authorized to sign said Plat for
and in the name of the Village and attach thereto the corporate seal.

Section 3: That the Village Clerk is hereby directed to record a copy of said Plat with the
Recorder of Deeds of Cook County, Illinois.

Section 4: That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage
and approval according to law.

VOTE: AYES: NAYS: ABSENT:

PASSED this day of 2023

APPROVED this day of 2023
APPROVED:

Mayor Craig B. Johnson
Village of Elk Grove Village
ATTEST:

Loretta M. Murphy, Village Clerk



$3aniLs $31vas

$713114$

3INIT NOILDO3S -

ANIT MOvEL3s -

ANIT L0 Ne=s s
INIT AYVANNOE =

aN39317 INN

1jo | LOLEOO-¥81 "ON 8suadi7 w4 cm_wwn_
LL-L¥-¢Z "OD MO0D Woo'pjewm MMM :qam £09/-899(0€9) :ud
# 133HS #3004 /8109 slouljj] ‘uojeayp) ‘€0z SUNS ‘peoy Jo)Sayouep 004z
XXX AOr 08/a0 SYUYY D IO O] 9IS JO ATHY) 8.794()
Het ‘NMvHa “NENS FANLDIITHOUV IdVISANYT - ONINIINIONI TIAID - DNIAIAYNS ANV
001=.1 1202-01-¢ L6ZhY s)_\’ )
3OS -31va #dor
ANIT IN3WN3SY3 -
1096°€S' G2 INOH ‘dLl™T] D¥ILITHY 2 HLVIDDIN “Em._.mmm_;
VM ‘3INA3TI39
0S} 3LINS NP M3INTY d3d 3SIATY  [£202-S2-1| 2
IS H19 3S S€T)L

ONIYIINIONI XIAVN ~ -HOd aIFuvd3ud| AOr M3IATY 93d 3SINTY |zz0z-¢-Ll 9

SIONITTI ‘IOVTTIA IAOHO 313 it ioutsi o bl B o B,

: AOP M3IATY IOVTIIA ¥3d ISINTY  £202-GL-8| ¥

1S NOIMVYO 0001

‘NolLvooT| AOF M3IAIY LNIITO ¥3d ISINTY  [2202-01-8| €

AOr M3IIATY LNIITO ¥3d ISINTY  |2202-6-8| €

NOISIAIAgGNS3y 40 1LVY1d |[ror M3INTY IOVTIIA ¥3d ISINTY £20Z-61-Z] |
Ag uonduosag sleq  |neyl

'ISIMYIHLO dJLON SSITINN SHVYEIY .8/S HLIM AILNIWNNOW SHINHOD 11V

66/.G58¢¢ 000 d3d LININISYI LNINVANY3C 0T

(200910418l IN3INNDOQ

NO Q31VIdNILNOD ATISNOIA3Yd SV Q3ILVOVA LON)
S0898596 '000 ¥3d LNINISYI AL 3179vD ANV 3IJOVNIVYJ
YILYM YIM3IS 'SAILITILN 2178Nd ANNOYOYIANN .GZ

§0898596 '000 ¥3d 3INIT XOVEL3IS 9NIATNG .GZ
(00910418l LN3IANNDOA

INND0A AS Q3LVDIQ3A 3WOJO0LIYIH
wmmgwm.hmzmm.._..m NOIMVYO

6S0LlY/100C "000 ¥3d 3NIT Ovgl3S 9NIaTINg .0S
50898596 '00d ¥3d 3INIT MOVEL3S 9INIQTING .Sz

(@13H) Y3INYOD

LHonve

SNIDSDIH) 22 3LNOY 11 01 SSIDOV Y INIIHIA 43H10 717V C

"L LOT NOY4 (AVOY SNIDOIH)
¢L 31N0OY Tl OL SSIOIV UVINIIHIA ON 39 TIVHS IHIHL 'L

S310ON SS3290V

SNSNIUNNNNNANNSNNAS S

SSNNN S ANSUANANG AN -

f szoz ‘61 1SnoONV }
f $3U1dX3 NOISSINWOI § S34IdX3 NOISSINNOD AN
B NOLONIHSYM 40 3LVLS § 92ez/bl/3
8 §TPZ0LZ# J118Nd AUVLON

"NOILVINOYIO IYNYILNI WOXH 39 TIVHS (avoy HVS 1M Z

aIngnd AYVIQN

=

©WZ AV 7&6:s$ >y 40 Avd 1;@ SIHL

g

Y M TYWWPFY v Tv3S TVINVLON ONY ONVH AW ¥3ANN NIAID

'HLYO4 13S NIF¥3HL S3ISOdYNd ANV S3SN IHL HOo4

‘NOILYHOJHOD QIVS 40 LOV AMVINNTOA ANY 3344 IHL SY ANV 1OV AYVLINNTOA ANY 3344
NMO SIH SY LNINNYLSNI AIVS O TV3S FLVHOJHO0D AIvS XI44V Aid ‘NOILYNOJNOD divs

T T e et e 1V 31399N0D NI S6'Le 40 v3S J1VHO4HO0D FHL 4O NVIQOLSND SV ‘IH LYHL IDAFTMONMOY JIHL ANY NIHL OSTY
. : e ; N HL ONY H1¥04 13S NIF¥3IHL SISOd¥Nd ANY SISN FHL YO ‘NOLLYHOLH0D
"SNIVWEILVM ANV ¥3M3S NIVINIVA NV 3LvH3dO ‘MINTH “LONELSNOD ‘AVT “TIVLSNI OL IOVIIIA G0898G96 D00 ¥3d LNINISYI AL 318v0 ANV 3FOVNIVHA S NOeWe mEelgaiclt B0 0 DR S M..BGE.OF SN GG AUV RO 8 I 1504 .19 .
: . : s o R L e e N ERERSC Z uo¥&; o dIVS 40 LOV AYVLNNTOA NV 3344 FHL SY ANV LOV AMVLNNTOA ANV 3344 NMO NISHL SY
3AO0YO M3 40 IOVTIIA IHL OL AILNVEO ANV ¥O4 IAYISIH AGINTH OSTV SI INTIWISYI AIvS Y3LVM "¥IMIS ‘SIILITILN DIMgnd ANNOYOY e UL RIS SRR e . : NY 3OVNIVYQ EIENE
'S3SOUNd ALMLLN O8N ¥O4 ININISYI AIVS HLIM JuISIALINI ION O IVHL S3SOdeind waro any . H3LYM'¥3M3S'SILILN O1and ANNO¥O¥3IANN .0L 500 ¥3d ‘ININISYI AL 318vD a MHOMLIN SHOO ML¥ LAN-TITY "00 V) AG ININNYLSNI AIVS FHL AFHIAITIA ANV GINDIS AIHL LVHL GIDATTMONMOY ANY NOSHId NI
S3S0duNd ALITILN O8N 404 INFWIASYI AIVS HLIM FHIFHTLNI LON OQ LYHL SISOdUNd ¥3HLO ONY : , "SILLN SNgnd ONNONONIANN .52 () M.Z.8€ «88S Pl b i
ONIdVOSANYT 'SENYHS ‘SNIAYVO ¥Od a3SN 39 AVW JNVS LNG LNFWISYI AIVS NO A30v1d 38 TIVHS YILVM “¥IM3S 'S3l ‘118 M.2V.6E.88S Q3NINY3L3A SY INOZ LSV INVTd JLVLS SIONITTI _ N aaws¢
SONIATING LININVNMI ON "STILINIOVL HONS 40 FJONVNILNIVIN ANV NOILYTIVASNI 3HL OL INIAIONI IOl 18 L tons € NSS! SNIOS3NGH SHLGL Gasosans Suv san MEL 0L
d34IND3Y ATEVNOSYIY 38 AVIN SY SONITAYS ANV ‘STHSNE ‘SIFHL HONS JNIL OL IWIL WO SAOWIN : : e ehgg N N N e ,
ANV WIML OL OSTY ONV ‘S3S0d¥N ¥3HLO ANV INOHJITIL WIMOd ‘LHOI 1vaH ¥O4 439N 38 O e R R e r ONIVv34g 40 sisve ANYS 3HL 38 OL 3W OL NMONY ATIVNOSX3d 7D RpSPoIHL 40
ALIDIELOFTE "ININAINOI TYORILOI T AIVS 40 SNVIW A9 ILNGIN1SIA ANV LINSNVEL O1 ANV 403831 A = ek SR e b e N MILVMANOLS JLIVAINd
SSTHOT ANV SSTHONI 4O LHOIN JHL HLIM ¥IHLIDO0L ‘FOIAYIS INOHJITIL AN DINLOT T HLIM il Wl sl T mE T R R e e Bl L T
ALHIdO¥d ONINIOrQY ANV ‘NIFYIHL ALYIJO¥d 40 SHANMO ANV SLNIQISTY ANV NOISIAIAENS IHL I oo ke Seplley e D3 s OF N ARG IS Gl S MENETEY MO COc-ce-80 N 0 Z 1334 - 31VOS OIHdVHO : any
ONIDINYIS 40 ISOdHNd IHL HO4 SALLIIOVL TYORILOTTI AMVSSIOIN HIHLO ANV ‘ST10d 318Y0 ‘STIavH ’ “”“H
‘SLINANOD ANNOYOYIANN ANY STHIM ‘SANLS 'SAND HOHONY ‘STOVHE ‘ST10d HSNd ‘STUNLONYLS o m i e = ' =i _Aoung Siius
310d 'S310d 40 ONILSISNOD INIWJINOI IAOWIY ANY MINTH ‘TLVO0T3Y ‘TLVHIAO ‘NIVINIVA AV h
"LOMMLSNOO “TTVLSNI OL AYVSSIOIN IHIHM 1V1d SIHL NO NMOHS SZOV1d DI18Nd ANV SIAING ‘SINY - e L O D YRLALHIOERR 00 'IvS3H04v 31v1s 3+ SEEEIEHENEE
'SAYVAIINOG 'SAVOY 'SLIFMLS FHL ¥IANN ANV ‘ONOTY ‘NOJN ‘NI ANV AL I19vD ANV ‘IOVNIVNG 46 Om 404 ANY NI O178Nd ASYLONY “RET T T I
HILYM HIMIS ‘STILITILN O118Nd MO LNTNISVI, AIHIVIN ¥O AL T18YO ANY ‘TOVNIVEA "SILYM 0 5% "5 N M hadae® Il
"HIM3S 'SAILMLLN O18Nd ANNOYOHIANN MO LINIWISYI LIV ANV Lv1d SIHL NO SINIT NI®HONS & s~ B 2 | Gk
A8 Q3LVOIANI NOZHIH S101 3HL 4O SLYVd ISOHL ¥3ANN ANV 'ONOTY ‘NOdN ‘NI ‘SNOISSY ANy YINYOD LV S o O o N S8 _ + 3 40 ALNNOO
SHOSSIOONS IAILOIJSTY HIFHL ‘ANV dI ‘SISIHONVYL NOISIATTIL 319V ANV 1R1V QoY NOYI GNNO 4 2 W = (WPuIWoA 20 Juvis
'ANVANOD NOSIA3 HLTVAMNOWNOD OL G3LNVHD NV 4O AIAYISTH AGINTH S| LINIWISYS Ny /. = S O LvoraiLua0 RiLde
=5 m 31VvII A
< m
SNOISINOYd LNIN3SV3 (*a '2°N*d) IDVYNIVIA 2 ALITILN 2179Nd g <
O% LINN M¥Vd o V_
; > N
m
88 L0T 30 &
S
@
<0
Nid o
. —ll @ SV ali o N
S3ULITIOVL SYO 40 TYAOWIN ANV LY LINN Mdvd H@ow el R o
NOILYQO134 "JONVNILNIVN ‘NOLLYTIVLSNI 3HL O 38 OL INIWISY3 AIVS . AL 319V0 ANV ‘TOVNIVAG o IVIY LSNANI ns iy Ay ¢ T Y )
HILYM "HIMIS ‘STILIILN O178Nd MO LINIWISYI. AIHHYIN HO JAL I18YD ANV “FOVNIVEA “SILYM A SNI9OIH o i N & AV Fo#3aN:
"YIMIS 'SIILILLN OIT8Nd ANNOYOHIANN HO- INIWISY3 .AIMEYIW ANV 1¥1d SIHL NO SANIT NIOME 88 LOT = N Z G _— IN
A8 @3LVOIONI NOIHIH S107T IHL 40O S18Vd ISOHL ¥3ANN ANY ONOTY ‘NOdN ‘NI ANV 1v1d SIHL NO —.—.— < e 1S3l
NMOHS S30V1d OI78Nd ANV ‘SIAING ‘SANV1 ‘SAYVATINOG ‘SAVOY ‘SLITHLS TIV NI ‘SNOISSY ANY e s A D = H / ‘
SHOSSIOONS SLI ANVANOD SYO HOOIN OL GILNVMO ANV HO- GIANISTY AGINIH S| LNINISYI Ny —.I. Aviy L enan e 2 .
SNI99IH : o - INIWJO TS0 ONV T SOOI SOINTS (ILIL
SNOISINOYd LNINISVYI JdOJIN z IA LL LOT . S6'¥SE 3.GG.LE 288N w. A i
a 1
m | =) 3
— C4 LINA MM¥y | - ,, ‘;\%
= widisnanC @Y | Q3ILNVYO AS3Y3IH ININISY3 AL 319vD | B o
o SNI9OOIH Beil ol ANV 39VNIVYQ ‘H3LVM ‘8¥3IM3IS L0z "av gy
A e . ‘SAILILN 2118Nd ANNO¥OYIANN .OL
i -1 _ 0NVAPIESHL T A A YMompey LV A31va
m |
o O Wi, | 'ZLS "ON 1OIM1SIA 3937100 ALINNWINOD O118Nd SIONITI ANV
o o] B _ 009812 (1+8) G0009 I SLHOITH NOLONITNY “QY JNIGEIOO 'S 1242 ¥h2 'ON LOIILSIA TOOHIS HOIH
= n ol _ dIHSNMOL ‘00€4-€65 (278) 50009 I ‘S1HOIIH NOLONITHY “Q¥ SLHOIFH NOLONITHY 'S €212 65 ‘ON
o r 21| | ] M.2Cc.l10. LI IN=9D LOI¥1S10 TOOHOS QI LVAITOSNOD ALINNNINOD HLIM S3M ALNIONd THL IVHL A4ILH30 Y3HLHNS IM
- m e \ l7°'09€=AHD . 'G3LVOIQNI NOFNIHL FLIL ANV FTALS THL
—.—.— | | \ 79°'2oE =04V d3ANN FNVS SHL 1dOAV ANV 3OATTIMONMOY AGITH STOA ANV HL¥O4H 13S NIFHIHL
! \ ’ i $3S0d¥Nd NV SISN JHL ¥OL ‘NOIHIH QILVOIANI SV A3 LLVId 39 OL JWYS IHL dISNYD SYH
=N _A _ | \ ogs'ere=avyd “1v1d GIX3NNY HL NI 038I40SIA ALYIdONd THL 40 HINMO SY 'SIONITTI NI SSANISNE 04
Ss3yaav V “ | : 0L Q3ZIHOHLNY NOILYHOJHOD V ‘NOILVHOJHNOD 140SONDIN 1VHL AdILNID OL SI SIHL
AS  ONIQY0D3Y _ | / ;
o ¥04 Q3LLINGNS N3I3E SVH 1vVid SIHL H i \ ; s oV 40 ALNnoD
| | i T
| ! 40 3IvIS
G ; | 200910/181 000 ¥3d ‘INIT MOVEL3S . . , :
:0L 178 xXv1 VW | ONIQING ANV INJWN3ISV3I h ; 200910418l "000 ¥3d ‘3NIT Xovg13s
AL TN o e i WIIYM IS SITILA SIENG G buo a4
g bl NOISIAIdgNs3y 40 Lv1d 4 | JLVOLAILYTD S.MIANMO
200910/18L "000 ¥3d ‘INIT MovEl3s \"4 \ Pyaai(] LIPS — ABS  su)
INIGTING ONV ININ3SY3I AL 379vD ONV 3OVNIVHQ : _ NOLMYO 000 | \ oy, : .. i Ll
K Y3LVM "¥3M3S 'SILIAILN 2178Nd ANNO¥OFIANN 0L _ _ - J \ & QONITY S,
/,//,,a%_/_\_; mo\w\&\\\\\\\\\\ €092-899 (0£9) :INOHd / _ _ (d) 6668l F o / L L >/ = | AINHOIHY 10 HINMO
S B Ay 7, 28109 SIONITTI ‘NOLVIHM . S . 2 Wy =iy et
N o2 SIONITT \\\\\\\ _ €02 31INS ‘avOY YILSIHONVIN 0042 ! _ @m\s_@m%_ 62S / =& 0 T 2 h LA o
%/ voivam ¥20Z '0¢ YIEWIAON :31va NOILYHIdX ISNION | | _ Z2.68S \ ‘w Sai, 998170790 %2
- . = L9SE "ON HOAIAYNS ANV SIONITTI \X’ M. 1S 12, e \ © = Y3ZNyp vy 55 QAQHE-TN0 o v3aNioNs ORS00 o.m_wm_uW_omm SIONITI
= E (@73H) Y¥3NYOD _ _ g \ & EEA NS
So! 199600680 (53 L1V 3did NOMI »#/€ ONNOA4 ! | (@13r) ¥3Ny0D 1v \ Q Z O 5SS
SO\ILIAIADTFOr /TS i ) _ \\ ! v\ b Rty
e Q§ | |_—+3did NO¥I .¥/€ ONNOS \ 1 0 L ORI S IS
N N _ _ X BTSN av gLz H0AVA AZ T SHI
Z | \ i , \ a3lva
\\\\N&w sl A%M,,,,,, ) €68l e e 2 l6yesz8Iz 000 ANV LLO-£0£-22-80 Nid \ nmwufwb M. 70.85,6 IN=9D \\\\Smmm_wm,,,% >..u¢32&\ﬂ :\L.Oﬂ
\\\\\\\\\\Q?ﬂu_ Ai¢nw,¢///// , h.‘.mm —. | [ [90908¢1Z 000 ¥3d IFIVNIVHQ C009l0/L1LSGL 2900 SV 0 o mo.mpua—l—o
“npan ‘AL7 'O¥IETHY ANV HLVHOOW “HILSEIM eits | £10-€09-22-80 Nid| fo——|ONV SIILILN O118Nd ¥O4 LN3IW3SV3 Gl 8102/61/90 Q30¥003Y ‘ 'NOISIAIQENS FHL 40 NOLLONMLSNOD 3HL 40 ISNVO3E ALYIdONd ONINIOFQY IHL OL IOVIAVA ISNVD AVIN
g o G Rt (e NOISIAIOENS3Y YY¥¥d ADO0TONHOIL LO'€EL=DYY SV SNOLLYHLNIONOO HONS NI SHINMO ANV ONINIOPQY 40 AL¥3dONd 3HL NO A3LISOd9A 38
H.,22.:27.,00S — T . . IN0¥O XT3 0S'Z001=aVvy LON T1IM SHI1YM JOV4NS HONS LVHL NV ‘3SN OL LHOR ¥ SYH Y3AIAIGENS THL HOIHM SNIVAQ
Z 20z av ”g} AVa 6¥£5Z81Z '000 ANV ] _ F ¢00910/18l "000 ¥3d IN3IW3ISV3I @) i H0 V3IHV OI79Nd OLNI SHIIVAM 3OV4HNS HONS 40 NOISH3AIAQ ANV NOLLO3 1109 IHL H04 Iavin
zz \.2.4; s 90908S1Z "000 ANV 2009107181 500 Y R e i ININIOVNYN YILVMNSOLS JIVAIN N338 SVH NOISIAOYd ILVNDIAY ‘AIONVHO 38 TIM JOVNIVHA NILVM JOVHNNS HONS dI LVHL
ININISYI AL 37870 ONV 3OVNIVNG I ILTM \ _ _ | O ‘JOTHIHL L¥Vd ANV HO NOISIAIENS SIHL 40 NOILONYLSNOD JHL A9 AIONVHO 39 LON
(z.MNI SIHL ‘SIONIT ‘NOLVIHM 1V Tv3S ILVHOdH00 ANY ANVH AW HIANN NIAIS “YIM3S 'STLINLN OI18Nd ANNOYOYIANN.CZ PRCHE e Yl Ku. i wod_,: ¥3IN¥OD m<zo TIIM SH3LYM 3OVARINS IHL 40 IOVNIVHA 3HL 4338 ANV I9ATIMONY ¥NO 40 1S38 IHLOL
_ did NOdI .+/§ ANNO4
"AIAUNS AUVANNOS v s~ Gl M.PC.SS.LZ2N=9D (39Vd NA ANV Y002 40 SIILNNOD
¥O4 SAHVANVLS WNIININ SIONITTI LNFHENO JHL OL SWHOANOD J0IAYIS TYNOISSIA0Nd SIHL (Q73H) ¥3NYOD 1V SSO¥D ONNOJ — ! ]! | o 0L ZZ1=adHD s°s (
] | —_
. h 8002 ‘61 LSNONV 31VA ‘T€4Z0D4E0L) YITWNN TINVA-ALINNINNOD 2009L0/L8L "00d _ _ _ 90061 ! i b
SIONITII "FOVTIIA IAOND Y13 HO4 d¥I I1vd JONVENSNI OO 3HL AG AILYNOISIA Sy ¥3d ININ3SY3 AL 378vD ANV JOVNIVAEQ ! Bl ) 3. wbel EEN 9€°'8¢C | =04V
(ONIGOOT4 TYWINIW 40 SFAV) WX INOZ NIHLIM SI ALYIAONd SIHL IVHL AJILIZ0 HHINN IM ‘4T LY M ‘Y3IM3IS ‘SIILITILN 2118Nd ANNO¥OYIANA 0L _ . " 1.20:1 2.68N 0S'99€=Aavy LANINILVLS IOVNIVIQ ¥ILVYM TOVHINS
= - I o Fo—
; 6¥£GZ8LZ 000 ANV 90908¢1Z "000 ONV _ | 8301721007 90
d3aN3aInv £ INIT NO ~ 6G /A140) @ tEe
d314VI¥IH ANV IHOJOLIYTIH SV 30D WWdIOINN SIONITT FHL 40 L FTOILYY 4O Z) NOISIAIG ¢009104181 "000 ¥3d 3NIT ¥OvEL3S ONIQTING ST OV 1S¥3.06'4 _ 3NIT XOvEL3S 9NIaTINg .0S
A8 QIZIHOHLNY SYIMOd TVIOIdS IHL ONISIONIXT SI HOIHM ANY NV1d IAISNIHIUANOD SEOHS. GNRD.A " _ T i e M. OY7.0E.80N=49D
V Q3ZIMOHLNY SYH HOIHM ‘JOVTIIA 3AONO XT3 40 IOVTIIA FHL 40 SLIAM ILYHOLHOD THL 10181 ° d .
NIHLIM S| NMYHA NOFHIH 1v1d IHL NO NMOHS ALE3dONd THL IVHL AdILY3D Y3HLNN4 IM i _ | SNIGTING NV INFAISY 3 81Y°'88=AHD
(4 +1'962 ! | AL 378v0 ONV 39VNIVYQ “YILVM ‘¥IMIS 0S'26=04V AN,
'403MIHL STYWIOIA ANV L334 NI NMOHS 38V STONVLSIA TIV ‘1v1d GIXINNY IHL AS NMOHS SV V1962 “ 'SALITNLN 2118Nd ANNOYOYIANN .01 ki
"SIONITTI ‘ALNNOD ¥O0D - g ORI JAulS.LZ2,.0LN=dD 00'06=Aavyd
NI 50898596 LNINNOOA SV 966} ‘L€ AN AIAHOITY 4JOIYIHL 1v1d FHL OL ONIGHOIDY A4 1,.8€,00S b - Faeia SL'EEL=AHD \ g YT “4OAVA T SIHL SIONITTI
'NVIQIYIN TYHIONINd QYIHL IHL 40 1SV3 L1 IONVA HLYON 17 dIHSNMOL ‘22 NOILOIS 40 () 3.9LLY .00S e ] g
H3LHVYNO LSIMHLNOS JHL NI NOISIAIQENS V ONIZE ‘NOISIAIAENS INIWLEYAIA IHI4 NI | 10T Sao o 68'€EE 1l =04Y T IVXRNTI0 ALNNOD 3HL 40 TVES ANV ANVH AW ¥3ANN NIAIS
Z 1308vd . 0S8'99€=avy 1]

“L009L¥SE61 "ON TT14 SHOLIANY HIANN 6102 ‘02 ¥IAWID3Q et Y ) L m.wm H "Lv1d GIXINNV IHL HLIM NOILLOINNOO NI S334 AMOLNLVLS TTv IAITOTY
d30Q¥003Y NOLLYOIA3A 40 1v1d FHL NI NOILYLMOJSNYYL 40 INIWLYVAAA SIONI (073H) ¥3NYOD LV Mot e 100 i IAVH | IVHL AJILH¥30 ¥3HIMNA | “1VTd GIXANNY IHL NI G3ANTONI ANV IHL 40 ANY
3HL OL 3AIANOD SVM HOIHM SISINTYd AIVS 40 NOILHOd IVHL 1d30X3 ANV SST1 3did NOMI .+/€ ANNO4 =i R g s om _.—._ LSNIVOY $3VS XVL I19VWIIATY ON ANV ‘SIXVL QI LIF4H04 AIVANN ON ‘SAXVL INIHEND

i o bt T PRI ERE Sl e = QIVANN ON ‘S3XVL LNINONITIA ON F8Y IHIHL IVHL AdILYID AGINTH 04 SIONITT ‘ALNAOD
'2009L0£181 "ON LNIWNOOQ SV 8L0Z ‘61 INNT GIANOOTY JOIMIHL 1vd IHL OL B » e N %009 40 43710 ALNNOD ¢ |
ONIQHOOIV ‘SIONITII ALNNOD X009 NI ‘NVIAIMIN TYdIONINd QYIHL SHL 40 1SV3 11 JONVS e aeg'geli - Lo
HLYON L¥ dIHSNMOL ‘22 NOILO3S 40 ¥ILHVND LSIMHLNOS THL 40 Luvd 40 NOISIAIGSNS M
V ONI38 ‘NOISIAIGENS Y M4Vd ADOTONHOIL IAOHD Y13 40 1v1d TVNI4 IHL NI £ 107 >>:OO~OOoOOZ _ & _N = e
[ o (SIONITTI 40 31vLS
1} 1308vd ( | 50 V_
‘ALY3dOYd a38I¥OSIA ONIMOTIOS IHL A3AINIQENSIY H3I3INIONT INO NOIDIN a <O - og'cr 35 N
ANV J3AIAENS IAVH “AL7 'OMIAFTHY ANV HLYHOIW “HILSEIM LYHL A4ILYID OL SI SIHL g Sd m S 61 PSS e o H.20.67. PN : e ALVII4ILEID SHYUTTO ALNNOD MO0
, geatftl)2 ; N@U~I& L 5 ietadldls e T I o “ Wma
SS (39vdna 40 ALNNOD Bkt i o
(SIONITTI 40 31vIS $2 "3'd ‘Sold asor g NA ul .m::O.mw el e _ N
N Vo030 3,3 :FDON I S 0673 e i Tt T
b Oz I e L MYT10 IOV TIA
5 TR # :
ININLMVAIa , mwso g gy, 0090, 0 .l~.l- %4 G 118311V
3HL A8 d3HINDIY 38 TIIM SAVMHOIH 31V1S O1 SAVMIAINA SSTOOV HOH SLINYId NO ADOd, LM g3y INIW3e 8 D0g - . /) ]
S:LNINLYVYAIA IHL NI AANIVAINOD SLNIWIHINDIY IHL SIIIN LYHL NV1d V "AIANIAY SY . S1vd M3s SHit M T Id 3Ny v s
OL NOILYT3Y NI MV IHL SSIAFH OL LOV NV, H40 ¢ HdVEOVHVd 40 INVASHNA SSIDIV AVMAYON 1 97gA 79 any mooqm: Js HOAYIN
Ol LO3dS3M HLIM NOLLY.LMOJSNYAL 40 INSW.LMVATA SIONITII 3HL AS GIAONAAY NI38 SYH Lvd SIHL INNOYe, 3 Qﬂﬁ;&a T e
Gz
3LVIIJ1LYID NOLLVLYOJSNVYL 40 LNIWLNVIIA SIONITTI SL0¥£9Z¢61 200 Nid SIYOV L9°6€ MO "14 DS §20'82L°L
«dw LNINISYI MIYM3AIS 0L
‘avT 0z T H40AVA SIHL
LO09L¥SEBL D00 ¥3d 10al Ol } 107 40 vIuv
'SIONITT *ALNNOD Y00D NI ‘NVIQININ TVAIONINd QYIHL IH1 40 1SV ‘L1 IONVY Q3A3ANOD i ‘SIONITTI “FOVTTIA IA0HD Y13 40 IDVTTIA
"HLYON ¥ dIHSNMOL ‘ZZ NOILD3S 40 ¥31¥VND LSYIHLNOS JHL 40 Luvd 40

NOISIAIdans3y

NOLMVYO 000L NI I LO1

SV NMONMX MON 3d¥V NOISIAIQENS AINIJN1HVYd3IA 3HI4d NI L LO1 ANV
"L0091¥SE6L "ON I1Id4 S HOLIANY Y3ANN 6102 ‘02 ¥39NWID3A ad3qd0203y
NOILVOId3d 40 1v1d IHL NI NOILVLHOdSNYY1 40 ININ1HVH3A SIONITTI IHL OL

U3AIANOD SVM HOIHM SISINIYd dIVS 40 NOILYOd IVHL 1d30X3 ANV SS31
NOISIANIAENS3Y MYVd ADOTONHO3IL IAOHED M3 NI 2 e

40 Lvid

NOISIAIdaNs3y 40 1Lv1d
NOILMYO 0001

dH1 40 S331SNYL 40 G¥VOg ANV HOAV FHL A9 A31dIDOV ANV d3anodddy

¥10-€0€-22-80 ‘Nid
€10-€0€-22-80 *Nid
€L0-€0€-22-80 NId
1 1L0-€0€-22-80 Nid
800-€£0€-22-80 :NId

SS (39Vd N ANV X002 40 S3ILNNOD
(SIONITTI 40 31vLS

S331SNAL 40 AYVOST ANV MOAVIN




	1. CALL TO ORDER
	2. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
	 INVOCATION
	3. APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF
	4. MAYOR & BOARD OF TRUSTEES' REPORT
	5. ACCOUNTS PAYABLE WARRANT:
	a. x
	FEBRUARY 28, 2023 WARRANT
	MARCH 14, 2023 WARRANT


	6. CONSENT AGENDA
	a. Consideration to award a professional service cont
	Orthophotography and Planimetric Mapping 

	b. Consideration of the following:To cancel the purch
	Two (2) F-150

	c. Consideration to increase the professional service
	Clock Tower & Veterans Memorial Park

	d. Consideration of a request to renew the services c
	Parkway Restoration - Sod Contract Renewal

	e. Consideration to award a professional service cont
	Business Park Ditch Maintenance Program

	f. Consideration to approve the second quarter financ
	Memorandum Report
	FY23Q2 Report

	g. Consideration to adopt Ordinance No. 3801 amending
	Memorandum Report
	Electrical Code Ordinance 2023 (1)

	h. Consideration to adopt Ordinance No. 3802 amending
	Memorandum Report
	CodeSection8-12B-1-2_Update_2023

	i. Consideration to adopt Ordinance No. 3803  grantin
	209 Oakton St.,Fence Variation

	j. Consideration to adopt Ordinance No. 3804 approvin
	Ord.Jurisdictional Transfer IDOT
	Midway Ct Jurisdictional Transfer

	k. Consideration to adopt Resolution No. 8-23 approvi
	Memorandum Report
	PlatofSubdivision, Microsoft
	Image_20230222_0001


	7. REGULAR AGENDA
	8. PLAN COMMISSION
	a. Consideration of a petition submitted by the Villa
	Memorandum Report

	b. Consideration of a petition submitted by Riverpoin

	9. ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS
	10. RECYCLING & WASTE COMMITTEE
	a. Sustainability Plan

	11. JUDICIARY, PLANNING AND ZONING COMMITTEE
	12. CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS COMMITTEE
	13. CABLE TELEVISION COMMITTEE
	14. YOUTH COMMITTEE 
	15. INFORMATION COMMITTEE
	16. BUSINESS LEADERS FORUMS
	17. HEALTH & COMMUNITY SERVICES
	18. PERSONNEL COMMITTEE
	19. AIRPORT UPDATE
	20. PARADE COMMITTEE
	21. MID-SUMMER CLASSICS CONCERT SERIES UPDATE
	22. SPECIAL EVENTS COMMITTEE
	23. LIQUOR COMMISSION
	24. REPORT FROM VILLAGE MANAGER
	25. REPORT FROM VILLAGE CLERK
	26. UNFINISHED BUSINESS
	a. Village Attorney - Direct the Village Attorney to 
	Memorandum Report


	27. NEW BUSINESS
	28. PUBLIC COMMENT
	29. ADJOURNMENT



