N

S V1 A~ W

AGENDA
REGULAR VILLAGE BOARD MEETING

October 22, 2019
7:00 PM
. CALL TO ORDER
. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
INVOCATION
.APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF OCTOBER 8, 2019
. MAYOR & BOARD OF TRUSTEES' REPORT
.ACCOUNTS PAYABLE WARRANT: OCTOBER 22,2019 $1,591,958.05
. CONSENT AGENDA

a. Consideration of a request from Saint Julian Eymard Catholic Church located at 601
Biesterfield Road to waive permit fees for a fence replacement project in the amount of

$25.

(It has been past practice of the Village Board to grant fee waivers for governmental and
non-profit organizations.
(The Director of Community Development recommends approval.)

b. Consideration of a request from First Baptist Church of Elk Grove Village located at 590
Tonne Road to waive permit fees for sidewalk and curb repairs in the amount of $177.

(It has been past practice of the Village Board to grant fee waivers for governmental and
non-profit organizations.
(The Director of Community Development recommends approval.)

c. Consideration of a request from the Elk Grove Park District to waive permit fees for
parking lot improvements at the Al Hattendorf Center located at 225 E. Elk Grove
Boulevard in the amount of $270.

(It has been past practice of the Village Board to grant fee waivers for governmental and
non-profit organizations.
(The Director of Community Development recommends approval.)

d. Concur with prior Village Board authorization to grant a request from Queen of the
Rosary

Page 1 of 6



Parish, 750 Elk Grove Boulevard, to waive fees for a temporary Class A Liquor License
and a Food Caterer's License in the amount of $3,000 for their annual Fall Fest on Sunday,
October 20, 2019.

(The fee for a Class A Liquor License is $2,900 and the fee for a Food Caterer's License is
$100.

(It has been past practice of the Village Board to grant fee waivers for governmental and
non-profit organizations.

(The Village Clerk recommends approval.)

e. Consideration to award funding for workforce development support consistent with the
Village’s Economic Development Vision for Business Excellence as presented to the
Board of Trustees for the modernization of the Elk Grove High School Fabrication Lab
payable to the High School District 214 Education Foundation for $100,000 funded
through the Busse Elmhurst TIF.

(Elk Grove Village desires to partner with Elk Grove High School to modernize the
school’s Fabrication Lab.

(The Elk Grove High School Fabrication Lab currently houses industry standard equipment
to allow students to learn how to work with metal, wood and other materials. Equipment
such as manual mills and lathes, a Haas CNC mill and lathe, plasma cutter, welding
equipment and various saw and grinders all provide students the opportunity to learn real-
world skills and industry credentials while still in high school.

(The Village through its business ambassador program has repeatedly heard that workforce
development is the most critical issue facing business today.

At this time, the proposal is to donate $100,000 to Elk Grove High School payable to High
School District 214 Education Foundation.

(The funds will help the high school expand the footprint of the lab, purchase modern
equipment, support micro-internships and provide even more student opportunities as the
program expands.

(The Director of Business Development and Marketing recommends approval.)

f. Consideration to award a purchase contract through the Illinois Department of Central
Management Services to Cargill Incorporated, of North Olmsted, OH for the delivery of
4,000 tons of bulk rock salt at $89.52 per ton in the amount of $358,080.

(The Village Board on March 26, 2019 approved a joint purchasing requisition through the
Illinois Department of Central Management Services (CMS) to procure 4,000 tons of bulk
rock salt with the option to increase or decrease the order by 20 percent, or 800 tons, if
necessary.

(On October 9, 2019, the Village was notified by CMS that bulk rock salt had been secured
for all joint purchasing participants.

(Adequate funds are available in the General Fund to purchase 4,000 tons of bulk rock salt
through the CMS contract with Cargill Incorporated.

(The Director of Public Works recommends approval.)

g. Consideration to accept the Comprehensive Annual Financial Report (CAFR) for the
Fiscal Year ended April 30, 2019.

Page 2 of 6



(The Comprehensive Annual Financial Report represents the findings of the annual audit
as performed by the independent auditor Lauterbach & Amen, LLP.

(The CAFR was recently completed.

(The Director of Finance recommends approval.)

. Consideration of a request to hold a Public Hearing before the Plan Commission to
consider a Petition for Rezoning the property at 1600 Oakton Street from I-1 to B-2.

(Sunrise Hotel Development LLC has petitioned the Village to rezone the property at 1600
Oakton from I-1 to B-2 for the purpose of redeveloping the property.

(The Petitioner plans to renovate the remainder of the existing 3-story building into a new
hotel offering, and to construct a new 4-story hotel and restaurant/retail building.
(Although not requiring a Public Hearing, the Petitioner will also be seeking a
resubdivision of the parcel from one (1) lot to three (3) lots.)

1. Consideration to hold the regular Village Board Meetings at 7:00 p.m. in 2020 on the

second and fourth Tuesday of the month with the following exceptions:

e March - add March 17, 2020 Budget Meeting for budget purposes at 6:00 p.m.;
e June - hold one regular Village Board Meeting to convene on June 16, 2020 at 7:00

p.m.;

e July - hold one regular Village Board Meeting to convene on July 14, 2020 at 5:00
p.m.;

e August - hold one regular Village Board Meeting to convene on August 11, 2020 at
7:00 p.m.;

e November - hold one regular Village Board Meeting to convene on November 17,
2020 at 7:00 p.m.; and

e December - hold one regular Village Board Meeting to convene on December 8,
2020 at 7:00 p.m.

(Start times may be adjusted due to elections or special events such as the Mid-Summer
Classics Concert Series.

(This schedule follows the past practice of the Village Board to hold only one meeting
during the months of June, July, August, November and December.)

j. Consideration to adopt Ordinance No. 3636 (attached) amending Title 5, Chapter 3 of the
Fire Prevention Code of the Municipal Code of the Village of Elk Grove.

(This Ordinance formally adopts the 2018 Edition of the International Fire Code (IFC) for
use by the Village. The code also includes minor amendments and/or deletions that were
deemed necessary to address conditions specific to Elk Grove Village.

(This Ordinance also adopts various standards of the National Fire Prevention Code
(NFPA codes and standards) not referenced in the IFC code, but which are desired by the
Fire Department.

(The IFC provides standardized regulations which are adopted by local governments for
application within their communities.

(Adoption of the 2018 IFC will now align with the 2018 building codes adopted by

Page 3 of 6



Community Development earlier this year.
(The Fire Chief recommends approval.)

. Consideration to adopt Resolution No. 62-19 authorizing the Mayor to execute a Letter of
Receipt stipulating the terms of an agreement for an application seeking a Cook County
Class 6B Property Tax Exemption status pursuant to the Cook County Real Property
Classification Ordinance as amended July 27, 2018 for certain real estate located at 700
Touhy Avenue.

(The Law Offices of Sarnoff & Baccash, on behalf of Benziger LLC (Applicant) is seeking
a Cook County Class 6B property tax exemption for 700 Touhy Ave.

(The Applicant intends to purchase the building for its related entity Frank Cooney Co.
Inc. for its operations consisting of light assembly warehousing and distribution of
educational furniture. The subject property consists of an approximately 126,654 square
foot site with an estimated 39,545 square foot building that has been vacant since March 4,
2019.

(The Applicant plans to spend approximately $53,500 to rehabilitate and improve the
subject property. These improvements are as follows: Interior buildout, sealcoat and stripe
the parking lot, reconstruct drive-in apron, remove and replace dead trees and landscaping,
clean up debris around site, and install a new monument sign and building facade sign.
(Frank Cooney Co. currently leases a 17,000 square foot building in Wood Dale, Illinois
and is outgrowing their site. Frank Cooney Co. plans to move its entire operation to the
subject property. As a result, Frank Cooney Co. plans to bring all 29 employees to the
subject property and plans to hire an additional 2-4 employees.

(The eligibility requirements for 6B status are new construction, substantial renovation or
buildings that have been vacant for a period of time.

(This site qualifies as it involves vacancy for less twenty-four (24) months with a purchase
for value, special circumstances, and significant rehabilitation.

(Property approved for Class 6B status allows the owner of the property to have the
assessment level lowered for a period of twelve years. The assessment schedule is 10% of
fair market value for ten years then 15% in the eleventh year and 20% in the twelfth year.
Industrial property is currently assessed at 25% of fair market value in Cook County.
(Upon approval, the Director of Business Development and Marketing will issue a Letter
of Receipt to the Applicant. The Letter of Receipt will allow the Applicant to file an
application with Cook County. Final approval is at the discretion of the Village Board and
contingent with the Applicant completing the improvements stated in their application.
(The Director of Business Development and Marketing recommends issuing a Letter of
Receipt.)

. Consideration to adopt Resolution No. 63-19 authorizing the Mayor to execute

an Intergovernmental Agreement between the Illinois Department of Healthcare and
Family Services (HFS) and the Village of Elk Grove Village to participate in the Ground
Emergency Medical Transportation (GEMT) Program for enhanced Medicaid billing for
ambulance services.

(The Village is an approved publicly operated emergency transportation provider in
[llinois.

Page 4 of 6



(Medicaid reimbursement rates for emergency transport services are significantly lower
than actual costs.

(The Illinois Department of Healthcare and Family Services (HFS) is pursuing additional
federal funding that would increase receipts for Medicaid transports.

(An intergovernmental agreement between the Village and HFS is required for
participation in the Ground Emergency Medical Transportation (GEMT) Program for
enhanced Medicaid billing for ambulance services.

(The Fire Chief recommends approval of the IGA for supplemental Medicaid
reimbursement.)

7. REGULAR AGENDA
a. Consideration to approve sign variations for Love's Travel Stops at 1900 Busse Road.

(Love's Travel Stops is a new automobile/truck fueling facility being developed within the
Village. Variations are requested to distinguish Love's brand from local competitors and
promote their business.

(Variations are necessary for an electronic fuel station sign which exceeds fifteen (15') feet
in width, fuel display digits which exceed twelve (12") inches in height and the display of
signage other than the fuel product pricing.

(An additional variation is required to exceed the allowable overall sign square footage for
the site.

(The Director of Community Development recommends approval.)

8. PLAN COMMISSION - Village Manager Rummel

a. PC Docket 19-11 - A Public Hearing for a Special Use permit to operate a 24-hour
automobile/truck fueling station and convenience store at property located at 1900 Busse
Road. (PH 10-07-19)

b. Request granted for a Public Hearing to consider Text Amendments to Section 2-2 and 3-
6:B of the Elk Grove Zoning Ordinance regarding principal structures. (Public Hearing
date has not yet been established.)

9. ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS - Village Manager Rummel
a. ZBA Docket 19-5 - A Public Hearing for a variation from the Elk Grove Village Zoning

Ordinance as it pertains to permitted locations for fences in residential zoning districts for
property located at 1666 Minnesota Drive (PH 10-10-19).

10. YOUTH COMMITTEE - Trustee Franke
11. BUSINESS LEADERS FORUMS - Trustee Lissner
12. CABLE TELEVISION COMMITTEE - Trustee Lissner

13. HEALTH & COMMUNITY SERVICES - Trustee Czarnik

Page 5 of 6



14. INFORMATION COMMITTEE - Trustee Lissner

15. RECYCLING & WASTE COMMITTEE - Trustee Feichter
16. PARADE COMMITTEE - Trustee Czarnik

17. PERSONNEL COMMITTEE - Trustee Franke

18. JUDICIARY, PLANNING AND ZONING COMMITTEE - Trustee Prochno

a. Telecommunication Facilities
19. CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS COMMITTEE - Trustee Czarnik
20. AIRPORT UPDATE
21. MID-SUMMER CLASSICS CONCERT SERIES UPDATE - Mayor Johnson
22.SPECIAL EVENTS COMMITTEE - Mayor Johnson
23. LIQUOR COMMISSION - Mayor Johnson
24. REPORT FROM VILLAGE MANAGER
25. REPORT FROM VILLAGE CLERK
26. UNFINISHED BUSINESS
27. NEW BUSINESS
28. PUBLIC COMMENT

29. ADJOURNMENT

In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act and other applicable Federal and
State laws, the meeting will be accessible to individuals with disabilities. Persons requiring
auxiliary aids and/or services should contact the Village Clerk, preferably no later than five
days before the meeting.

Page 6 of 6



ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING TITLE 5, CHAPTERS 3:5-3-1, 3:5-3-2 OF THE FIRE
ACTIVITY CODE OF THE MUNICIPAL CODE OF THE VILLAGE OF ELK GROVE
VILLAGE

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the Mayor and Board of Trustees of the
Village of Elk Grove Village, Counties of Cook and DuPage, Illinois, as follows:

Section 1: That Section 5-3-1: be amended to read as follows:

A. Code Adopted: There is hereby adopted by reference as if fully set out herein, that
certain code known as the International Fire Code 2018 edition, prepared and
published by the International Code Council, together with the additions, insertions,
deletions and changes hereinafter set forth, one (1) copy which is available for
inspection and on file in the office of the Village Clerk. This code shall govern the
purpose of prescribing regulations governing conditions hazardous to life and
property from fire or explosion.

Section 2: That Section 5-3-2: be amended to read as follows:

B. Amendments: The following additions, insertions, deletions and changes are
hereby made to the International Fire Code, 2018 edition:

SECTION 101
ADMINISTRATION - GENERAL

101.1 is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of the Village of ElIk Grove Village,
hereinafter referred to as "this code.”

101.2.1 is amended to read as follows:

101.2.1 Appendices. The appendixes are to be considered “shall” requirements, not “should”
information.

101.5.1 is added to read as follows:
101.5.1 Conflicting Code Information. In the event this code or any portion thereof shall be in
conflict with another code or portion thereof on the same subject matter the more stringent code

shall apply.

101.6 is added to read as follows:



101.6 NFPA Appendixes: The appendixes of all NFPA standards are to be considered as part of
each standard and are considered “shall” requirements, not “should” information.

SECTION 102
APPLICABILITY
102.3 is amended to read as follows:

102.3 Change of use or occupancy. A change of use or occupancy shall not be made to any
building or tenant space without approval of the Fire Code Official. The Fire Code Official shall
certify that such building or tenant space meets the provisions of law governing building
construction for the proposed new use or occupancy. The building is required to comply with the
fire protection requirements of this code.

SECTION 104
GENERAL AUTHORITY AND RESPONSIBILITIES

104.6.5 is added to read as follows:
104.6.5 Written request for records. Any person wanting records from the Inspectional Services
Division must submit in writing on the Village of Elk Grove Village Written Request for Records
form. (Appendix E)

SECTION 105

PERMITS

105.3.6 is amended to read as follows:
105.3.6 Compliance With Code: All work performed under a permit issued shall conform to the
approved application and plans and any approved amendments thereto. It shall be unlawful for any
owner, agent, architect, structural engineer, contractor, or builder engaged in erecting, altering, or
repairing any structure or appurtenance thereof to make any departure from the drawing or plans

as approved by the code official. Any of the requirements in this ordinance shall render the same
void.

The Village of ElIk Grove Village reserves the rights to send out any plan reviews to a third party
agency because of the level of difficulty or availability of personal to perform the review. The third
party agency shall invoice the permit holder directly for the services rendered.

105.3.6.1 is added to read as follows:

105.3.6.1 Compliance: No building or structure shall be constructed or occupied if said building
or structure is not in compliance with this ordinance. An occupancy permit shall be issued by the
Village of ElIk Grove Village Community Development Department prior to occupancy when it is
determined the building or structure has been constructed in compliance with this ordinance.

105.3.9 is added to read as follows:



105.3.9 Certificate of occupancy. The Code Official shall issue a certificate of occupancy only
if, after inspection, he/she finds that such building or tenant space complies with the provisions of
this Ordinance and all other Ordinances of the Village of Elk Grove Village, and that said building
or tenant space has been completed in accordance with the approved plans and documents filed in
support of the Application for Building Permit relating to said building or tenant space. Such
Certificate shall show the permitted use for the building or tenant space.

In accordance with Attachment B (Fees), all outstanding fees shall be paid in full, prior to issuance
of a certificate of occupancy by the Code Official.

105.4.4 is amended to read as follows:

105.4.4 Approved documents. Construction documents approved by the Fire Code Official are
approved with the intent that such construction documents comply in all respects with this code.
Review and approval by the Fire Code Official shall not relieve the applicant of the responsibility
of compliance with this code. Approval or disapproval shall be addressed in letter form and
forwarded to the Village of Elk Grove Village Community Development Department, stating
reason(s) for disapproval or all requirements to be met prior to occupancy.

SECTION 107
INSPECTIONS

107.5 is added to read as follows:

107.5 Inspection and Enforcement process: In its efforts to ensure that fire protection safety for
its residents and businesses of the Village of ElIk Grove Village, the Inspectional Services Division
shall inspect all buildings in the Village for compliance with the fire safety codes of the Village
on a regular basis. The Division S.O.P. shall establish the process by which the Division shall
inspect and issue citations for failure to comply with the Village fire safety codes.

SECTION 109
BOARD OF APPEALS

109.1 is amended to read as follows:

109.1 Board of appeals established. In order to hear and decide appeals of orders, decisions or
determinations made by the code official relative to the application and interpretation of this code,
there shall be and is hereby created a board of appeals consisting of members who are qualified by
experience and training to pass on matters pertaining to this code and who are not employees of
the jurisdiction. The code official shall be an ex officio member of said board but shall have no
vote on any matter before the board. The board of appeals shall be the board of trustees of the
Village of ElIk Grove Village. The board shall adopt rules of procedure for conducting its business,
and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the appellant with a duplicate copy to the
code official.



SECTION 110
VIOLATIONS

110.3 is amended to read as follows:

110.3 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a provision of this code or shall fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the code official, or of a permit
or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of an ordinance violation,
punishable by a fine of not less than fifty ($50.00) dollars nor more than five ($500.00) hundred
dollars, plus all legal fees and all costs caused by enforcement. Such fees and costs shall include,
but not limited to, staff costs of inspection or re-inspection, legal fees, and staff cost of
enforcement. Each day that a violation continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed
a separate offense.

SECTION 111
UNSAFE BUILDINGS

111.5 is added to read as follows:

111.5 Fire watch. Where conditions exist that are deemed hazardous to life and property by the
code official, a fire watch shall be implemented. The code official shall determine the number of
personnel required and the duration necessary for the fire watch. A fee of $75.00 per hour for each
Village of Elk Grove Village personnel assigned to the fire watch shall be charged. Conditions
that may require a fire watch shall include, but are not limited to, the following:

A. Newly constructed building opened for occupancy prior to completion of the fire safety
equipment and supervision;

B. Building in which the fire safety equipment and supervision is placed out-of-service and
will not be restored within two (2) hours;

C. Building with an occupancy load greater than the posted numbers;

D. Special programs or vents where there will be space for standing room over the seating
area and the exits will handle both seated and standing people; and

E. Situations where the fire-load is greater than the normal day-to-day operation.

SECTION 112
STOP WORK ORDER

112.4 is amended to read as follows:

112.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after having been served with
a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or

4



unsafe condition, shall be liable to a fine of not less than fifty ($50.00) dollars or more than five
($500.00) hundred dollars.

SECTION 202
GENERAL DEFINITIONS

Board of Trustees is added to read as follows:

BOARD OF TRUSTEES: The corporate authorities of the Village of EIk Grove Village.
Building is added to read as follows:

BUILDING: Any structure used or intended for supporting or sheltering any use of occupancy.
Building Code is added to read as follows:

BUILDING CODE: The Building Code and its amendments as adopted by the Trustees of the
Village of ElIk Grove Village.

Certificate of Use and Occupancy is added to read as follows:

CERTIFICATE OF USE AND OCCUPANCY. The certificate issued by the Code Official
which, permits the use of a building or tenant space in accordance with the approved plans and
specifications and which certifies compliance with the provisions of law for the use and occupancy
of the building or tenant space in its several parts together with any special stipulations or
conditions of the building permit.

Change of Occupancy is amended to read as follows:

CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY. The change in purpose for which a building or part thereof is used
or intended to be used including a change in tenants or tenant space.

Change of Use is added to read as follows:

CHANGE OF USE. An alteration by change of use in a building or tenant space heretofore
existing to a new use group which imposes other special provisions of law governing building
construction, equipment or means of egress.

Code Official is added to read as follows:

CODE OFFICIAL: The designated Fire Marshal of the Village of Elk Grove Village and or
his/her subordinates.

Fire Watch is amended to read as follows:

FIRE WATCH. A temporary measure intended to ensure continuous and systematic surveillance
of a building or portion thereof by one or more qualified Village of EIk Grove Village Fire



Department personnel, for the purpose of identifying and controlling fire hazards, detecting early
signs of unwanted fire, and raising an alarm of fire and notifying the fire department.

SECTION 307
OPEN BURNING AND RECREATIONAL FIRES

307.4.1 is amended to read as follows:

307.4.1 Bonfires. A bonfire shall not be conducted within 50 feet of a structure or combustible
material. Conditions which could cause said fire to spread to within 50 feet of a structure or
combustible material shall be eliminated prior to ignition. Bonfires shall not exceed 4 feet in
diameter and/or 16 square feet. Bonfires may only contain cut, natural wood.

307.4.2 is amended to read as follows:

307.4.2 Recreational fires. Recreational fires shall not be conducted within 25 feet of a structure
or combustible material. Conditions which could cause a fire to spread within 25 feet of a structure
or combustible material shall be eliminated prior to ignition. Recreation fires shall be contained
in a manufactured, outdoor fireplace/pit. Containers for recreational fires shall be no greater than
30 inches in diameter and/or 6.25 square feet. Recreation fires may only contain cut, natural wood
that will fit within the confines of the container.

SECTION 308
OPEN FLAMES

308.1.4 is amended to read as follows:

308.1.4 Open-flame cooking devices: Charcoal burners and other open-flame cooking devices
shall not be operated on combustible balconies or within 10 feet (3048 mm) of combustible
construction.

Exceptions:

1. One- and two-family dwellings.

2. Where buildings, balconies and decks are protected by an automatic
Sprinkler system.

3. LP-gas cooking devices having LP-gas container with a water capacity not
greater than 2 %2 pounds [nominal 1 pound (0.454 kg) LP-gas capacity].

4. When an open-flame cooking device is attended by an adult and a minimum
10 Ib. dry chemical (class B or class ABC) fire extinguisher is located within
ten (10) feet of the cooking device.

5. When an LP-gas fueled cooking device is attended by an adult and a
Minimum 10 Ib. dry chemical (class B or class ABC) fire extinguisher is
located within ten (10) feet of the cooking device.

SECTION 309



POWERED INDUSTRIAL TRUCKS AND EQUIPMENT

309.5 is amended to read as follows:

309.5 Fire extinguishers. Battery charging areas shall be provided with a fire extinguisher
complying with section 906 having a 4A60BC rating within 20 feet of the battery charger.

SECTION 311
VACANT PREMISES

311.2.2 is amended to read as follows:

311.2.2 Fire Protection. Fire alarm, fire pumps, sprinkler and standpipe systems shall be
maintained in an operable condition at all times.

Exception 1 & 2 is deleted.
311.2.4 is added to read as follows:

311.2.4 Fire Protection Up Grades: Any building that is vacant more that 30 days or were change
of use and/or occupancy occurs shall comply with this ordinance before any use of occupancy will
be granted. All requirements shall comply with section 907.2.

SECTION 312
VEHICLE IMPACT PROTECTION

312.4 is added to read as follows:

312.4 Gas Meter Protection: Where deemed necessary by the Fire Code Official, guards shall be
installed around gas meters to provide protection against vehicular damage.

SECTION 404
FIRE SAFETY AND EVACUATION PLANS

404.2 is amended to read as follows:

404.2 Where required. An approved fire safety and evacuation plan shall be prepared and
maintained for all occupancies and buildings as required by the code official.

SECTION 503
FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS

503.1 is amended to read as follows:



503.1 Where required. Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided and maintained in
accordance with sections 503.1.1- 503.1.3. The Fire Code Official shall require and designate
public and private fire lanes as deemed necessary for effective and efficient operation of fire
apparatus.

Exception 1 to 503.1.1 is deleted.
503.1.1.1 is added to read:

503.1.1.1 Public/Private access for fire apparatus. Public or private access, for all occupancy
classification with the exception of R-3 shall be provided for fire apparatus when the building is
three stories or higher. Fire lane access for an aerial ladder and/or mechanically elevated
mechanism shall be required to cover three-quarters of all exterior building walls.

503.2.1 is amended to read:

503.2.1 Dimensions. The minimum width of fire lanes shall be 20 feet and an inside radius of 45
feet shall be provided to accommodate vehicles when turning. The fire lanes shall be placed 25
feet from the building to the edge of the fire lane or 35 feet to the center of the fire lane to the
building. Public parking areas used as fire lanes shall have 25 feet to the rear of parking spaces to
the building and 24 feet of open area to the rear of the parking spaces. Fire lanes shall have an
unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 15 feet. The road shall be constructed with the
capability to handle 80,000 pounds (weight of fire apparatus).

503.2.4 is amended to read:

503.2.4 Turning radius. The required turning radius for a fire apparatus access road shall be
determined by the Fire Code Official. Fire lane turn around shall have an inside radius of 45 feet
and shall have a driving area width of 27 feet in order to accommodate vehicles.

503.2.5 is amended to read as follows:

503.2.5 Dead ends. Dead end fire apparatus access roads in access of 150 feet in length shall be
provided with an approved area for turning around fire apparatus. All cul-de-sacs shall have a
minimum diameter of 90 feet if parking is allowed

503.3.1 is added to read as follows:

503.3.1 Fire Lanes. All fire lanes shall be posted with the appropriate signage.

SECTION 505
PREMISES IDENTIFICATION

505.1 is amended to read as follows:



505.1 Address numbers. New and existing buildings and tenant spaces shall have approved
address numbers, building numbers or approved building identification placed in a position that is
plainly legible and visible from the street or road fronting the property. These numbers shall
contrast with their background. Addresses on glass shall be white. Address numbers shall be
Arabic numerals or alphabet letters. Exterior numbers shall be a minimum of 6 inches high.
Interior tenant spaces shall be a minimum 4-inch high numbers. Where access is by means of a
private road and the building cannot be viewed from public way, a monument, pole, or other sign
or means shall be used to identify the structure.

SECTION 506
KEY BOXES

506.1 is amended to read as follows:

506.1 When required. All newly constructed buildings or tenant spaces are required to install an
approved key box in an accessible location approved by the code official and shall contain keys
and other items necessary to provide the fire department access to the building at locked points of
ingress and egress whether on the interior or exterior of such building, to include building systems,
controls and devices, such as but not limited to: Fire alarm systems, automatic fire sprinkler
systems, elevator controls, electrical rooms and mechanical rooms.

Exception: Key boxes are not required for single-family detached dwellings, unless equipped
with a fire sprinkler system.

506.1.2 is added to read as follows:

506.1.2 Type of key box. The type of key box approved for use by the Village of Elk Grove
Village is the Knox box brand key vault/rapid entry system. The Village of Elk Grove Village
shall be in complete control of key box and rapid entry system authorization and operation. The
Village of ElIk Grove Village shall not be required to purchase or sell any key box or rapid entry
system products. The size of the required Knox box will be based upon the number of keys to be
secured in the box and will be at the discretion of the Fire Code Official.

506.1.3 is added to read as follows:

506.1.3 Location and number: Knox box location. The installation location of the Knox box
shall be approved by the Fire Code Official. The Knox box shall be mounted at the height of 5
(five) feet above the finished floor. The total number of Knox Boxes required shall be determined
by the Code Official.

506.1.4 is added to read as follows:

506.1.4 Outside Strobe. A weatherproof clear outside strobe shall be installed over the Knox box.
All outside strobes shall be 75 candela minimum.

506.3 is added to read as follows:



506.3 Electric shunt switch. An electric Knox shunt/shut off switch shall be required in buildings
of all use groups with multiple electric panel rooms and/or buildings having an 800 ampere service
or greater.
a.) Switch will be mounted next to main Knox, box or at a location specified by the
Fire Code Official.
b.) Switch should be mounted at a height of 5 (five) feet from the finished floor.

SECTION 507
FIRE PROTECTION WATER SUPPLIES
507.2.3 is added to read as follows:

507.2.3 Fire Hydrant Water Supply. The fire hydrants shall be on a domestic water system.
The fire hydrant water supply shall be separate from the fire protection system water supply.

507.5.1 is amended to read as follows:

507.5.1 Where required. Fire hydrants shall be located along a fire apparatus access road so that
no portion of a building or facility will be more than 300 feet from any hydrant. Additional
hydrants and mains shall be provided where required by the code official. Delete exemptions #1
& 2.

507.5.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

507.5.1. Hydrant for standpipe systems. Hydrants shall be located within 50 feet to any fire
department sprinkler or standpipe connection as determined by the code official. Delete exemption

507.5.1.2 is added to read as follows:

507.5.1.2 Fire department connections. Hydrants shall be located within 50 feet to any fire
department sprinkler or standpipe connection as determined by the code official.

507.5.7 is added to read as follows:
507.5.7 Fire hydrant installation. Fire hydrants shall be installed so that:

1. Access: Access to fire hydrants shall be by any approved roadway as specified by this
code.

2. Distance to Roadways: Hydrants shall be located approximately ten (10) feet from all
weather roadways.

10



3. Pumper Outlet Direction: Each hydrant shall have the pumper (steamer) connection facing
the primary roadway and shall be accessible so that a connection can be made between the
hydrant and the apparatus located in the street with twenty (20) feet of suction hose.

4. Hydrant Outlet Location: Fire hydrant outlets shall be a minimum of eighteen (18) inches
and no more than thirty-six (36) inches above the finished grade.

5. Hydrant Type: Fire hydrants used in conjunction with water supplies shall be of a type
acceptable to the Village of EIk Grove Village.

SECTION 508
FIRE COMMAND CENTER

508.1.7 is added to read as follows:

508.1.7 Mall Fire Command Station: A fire command station for fire department operations shall
be provided in a location approved by the fire department. The fire command station shall contain:
the voice/alarm signaling system controls; the fire department communication system controls; the
automatic fire detection and alarm system annunciator panels; an annunciator that visually
indicates the floor location of the elevators and weather they are in operational; status indicators
and controls air handling systems; sprinkler valve and water flow detector display panels; and a
public telephone system.

SECTION 509
FIRE DEPARTMENT AND UTILITY EQUIPMENT IDENTIFICATION AND ACCESS

509.3 is added to read as follows:

509.3 Access to fire equipment: In multiple single-family dwellings where there is no common
area, fire alarm panels and sprinkler system valves shall be located in a room accessible only to
Village Fire Department personnel from the exterior of the building. The fire department shall
have access at any time to such equipment without entering an individual dwelling unit.

509.4 is added to read as follows:

509.4 Fire pump rooms: Access to the fire pump room shall be on the main level of discharge,
and accessible from the exterior and interior of the building.

SECTION 511
EMERGENCY NOTIFICATION

511.1 is added to read as follows:
511.1 Emergency notification. It shall be the responsibility of the property owner and/or manager

to provide current contact persons and telephone numbers of persons to be notified in case of an
emergency involving their property and/or building.

11



SECTION 606
ELEVATOR OPERATION, MAINTENANCE AND FIRE SERVICE KEYS

606.1.1 is added to read as follows:

606.1.1 Automatic elevators for fire department use. One elevator to be installed in all new
buildings shall be sized for stretcher use by the fire department. Minimum size to be 4000
pounds with a clear inside dimension of 7” wide x 4’3” deep with a 42” side slide door.

606.9 is added to read as follows:

606.9 Elevator phone. All required emergency elevator phones shall directly dial the Village of
Elk Grove Village's Communications Center via the phone number designated by the code official.

SECTION 607
COMMERCIAL KITCHEN HOODS
607.5 is added to read as follows:

607.5 Hood system suppression. All hood and duct extinguishing systems shall comply with
the U.L. Standard # 300 and be supervised by the buildings fire alarm system.

SECTION 806

NATURAL DECORATIVE VEGETATION IN
NEW AND EXISTING BUILDINGS

806.1.1 is amended to read as follows:
806.1.1 Restricted occupancies. Natural cut trees shall be prohibited in groups, A, B, E, I, M, R-

1, R-2 and R-4. Exception is deleted.
SECTION 807

DECORATIVE MATERIALS AND ARTIFICIAL DECORATIVE
VEGETATION IN NEW AND EXISTING BUILDINGS

Exceptions 1 and 2 to 807.5.2.1 are deleted.
Exceptions 1 and 2 to 807.5.5.1 are deleted.
SECTION 901

FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS - GENERAL

901.2.2 is added to read as follows:

12



901.2.2 Fire Alarm Installers. The Illinois Department of Regulation has the following
requirements for alarm system installers:

1. Private alarm contractor’s license, issued by the Department of Professional Regulation,
is required for an individual to be able to install, repair or modify fire alarm systems.

2. It is important to note the requirements allow an exemption from obtaining a “Private
Alarm Contractor’s License if the fire alarm system work is performed by a “Licensed
Electrical Contractor”.

901.6.3 is amended to read as follows:

901.6.3 Records. All contractors who preform inspections, testing, and/or maintenance required
by referenced standards of the International Fire Code shall submit the records of said inspections,
test, and/or maintenance to the Village in such form and such method approved by the Fire Code
Official. The owner of the subject property being inspected or tested shall be additionally
responsible for its contactor who performs the test or inspections to submit same to the Village in
such form and such method approved by the Fire Code Official.

901.9.1 is added to read as follows:

901.9.1 Materials and contents information. Construction documents for fire protection systems
permit shall include information on the contents, the occupancy, the location and arrangement of
the structure, and the contents involved, the exposure to any hazard, the extent of the system
coverage, the suppression system design criteria, the supply and extinguishing agents, the location
of any standpipes, and the location and method an operation of any detection and alarm devices.

901.11 is added to read as follows:

901.11 Rooms containing fire protection control equipment. Rooms containing fire protection
control equipment shall be provided with direct access from the exterior or interior of the building.
All new and existing entrance doors shall bear a sign on the exterior of the door with four inch (4")
high letters indicating “FACP”, "Sprinkler Room", “Fire Pump”. Additional sighage may be
required in cases where the riser serves more than one (1) tenant. New and existing rooms shall
contain emergency lighting. Rooms designated as FACP, Sprinkler Rooms, or Fire Pump Rooms
shall not be used for any other purpose.

SECTION 902

DEFINITIONS
Total Area is added to read as follows:
TOTAL AREA. For purposes of calculating total square feet and fire areas, the total floor area
includes mezzanines and basements contained within the surrounding exterior walls of the building
on all floors and levels, which are added together. The area included within the surrounding

exterior walls of a building including roof overhangs, extensions, and all enclosed extensions,
which are also added to the calculation. Areas of a building not provided with surrounding walls

13



shall be included within the building area if such areas are included within the horizontal projection
of the roof or floor above. Interior walls, including fire walls, and party walls, shall not be
considered as walls which divide a structure into two or more separate buildings, but a structure
containing such interior walls shall be considered as one building for the purpose of this section.

SECTION 903
AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS

903.2.1.1 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.1.1 Group A-1: An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group A-1
occupancies.

903.2.1.2 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.1.2 Group A-2: An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group
A-2 occupancies.

903.2.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.1.3 Group A-3: An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group
A-3 occupancies.

903.2.1.4 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.1.4 Group A-4: An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group
A-4 occupancies.

903.2.1.5 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.1.5 Group A-5: An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group
A-5 occupancies.

903.2.1.8 is added to read as follows:

903.2.1.8 All Group A Occupancies: Quick response sprinklers shall be provided throughout all
Group A occupancies.

903.2.2.1 is added to read as follows:

903.2.2.1 Group B: An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group B
occupancies.

903.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

14



903.2.3 Group E: An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group E
occupancies.

903.2.4 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.4 Group F-1: An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all Group F-1
occupancies. Provide all spec warehouse buildings with a ceiling roof height of 25 feet or greater
to be protected with an ESFR fire sprinkler system or a hydraulically calculated system for a class
IV commaodities with rack storage calculated to the greatest storage height.

903.2.5 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.5 Group H: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in all Group H occupancies.
903.2.5.1 is deleted.

903.2.5.2 is deleted.

Table 903.2.5.2 is deleted.

903.2.5.3 is deleted.

903.2.6 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.6 Group I: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in all Group | occupancies,
INCLUDING ALL: Group homes, half-way houses, residential board and care facilities,
congregate care facilities, assisted living facilities, alcohol and drug centers and social
rehabilitation facilities, regardless of the number of persons occupying such buildings.

903.2.7 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.7Group M: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in all Group M occupancies.
903.2.7.1 is deleted.

903.2.8 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.8 Group R: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in all Group R occupancies.
903.2.9 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.9 Group S-1: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in all Group S-1 occupancies.

903.2.9.1 is amended to read as follows:

15



903.2.9.1 Repair garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in all repair garage
occupancies.

903.2.9.2 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.9.2 Bulk storage of tires. An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in all Bulk
Storage of Tires buildings.

903.2.10 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.10 Group S-2. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided throughout all buildings
classified as a parking garage.

903.2.10.1 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.10.1 Commercial parking garages. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided
throughout all buildings used for storage of commercial trucks, trailers, transport container units
or buses.

903.2.11 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.11 Group U: An automatic sprinkler system shall be installed in all Group U occupancies.

903.2.11.1 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.11.1 Stories and basements without openings. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
installed without openings.

903.2.11.1.2 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.11.1.2 Openings on one side only. Where openings in a story are provided on only one side
and the opposite wall of such story, the story shall be equipped throughout with an automatic
sprinkler system.

903.2.11.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.11.1.3 Basements. All basements shall be equipped throughout with and approved
automatic sprinkler system.

903.3.1 is amended to read as follows:
903.3.1 Standards: Sprinkler systems shall be designed and installed in accordance with sections
903.3.1.1 through 903.3.1.3. All sprinkler piping material is to be approved metallic piping. Plastic

pipe is not allowed for sprinkler pipe material except for an R-3 use group
903.3.1.1.1 is deleted.

16



903.3.1.2 is amended to read as follows:

903.3.1.2 NFPA 13R Sprinkler systems. Automatic sprinkler systems in Group R occupancies
up to and including three stories in height shall be installed in accordance with NFPA 13R. An
addressable fire alarm system shall be installed as required by the Village of ElIk Grove Village.

903.3.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D Sprinkler systems: Automatic sprinkler systems shall be installed
throughout one-and two-family dwellings and townhouses in accordance with NFPA 13D.

903.3.1.3.1 is added to read as follows:

903.3.1.3.1 NFPA 13D Sprinkler systems requirements: Automatic sprinkler systems shall be
installed in all attached garages.

903.3.5 is amended to read as follows:

903.3.5 Water supplies. Water supplies for automatic sprinkler systems shall comply with this
section and the standards referenced in Section 903.3.1. The potable water supply shall be
protected against backflow in accordance with the requirements of this section and the
International Plumbing code and the Illinois Plumbing Code.

903.3.5.3 is added to read as follows:

903.3.5.3 Safety factor. Hydraulically calculated sprinkler systems shall maintain a minimum of
10% or five (5) pounds per square inch cushion (whichever is greater) between the seasonal low
water supply and the total sprinkler demand. The total sprinkler demand shall include the sprinkler
demand and the hose stream demand. The flow data used in these calculations shall be no more
than one year old.

903.3.5.4 is added to read as follows:

903.3.5.4 Riser Access. All new sprinkler risers and associated equipment shall be located in a
separate room with a minimum of one (1) hour construction.

903.3.5.4.1 is added to read as follows:

903.3.5.4.1 Multi tenant occupancy. When an automatic fire suppression system is installed in a
multi tenant building, each tenant shall have its own sprinkler supply line off the main or riser with
its own water flow switch and control valve. A strobe light shall be mounted on the exterior front
of that tenant space and as indicated in Section 903.4. The strobe light shall activate upon water
flow and/or fire alarm activation within the individual unit.

903.3.7 is amended to read as follows:

17



903.3.7 Fire department connections. The location of the fire department connection shall be
on the street side of the building or in a method approved by the Fire Code Official. The fire
department connection shall consist of one five inch Storz coupling on a 30 degree elbow mounted
between 36 inches and 48 inches above the finished floor. The FDC shall not be located within a
delayed access location. Fences, gates, trees, shrubs or other landscaping materials shall not be
installed to prohibit access to the FDC.

Exceptions 2, 4 and 5 to 903.4 are deleted.
903.4.1 is amended to read as follows:
903.4.1 Signals: Alarm, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly different and shall be

monitored by a fire alarm, in a method approved by the Code Official in accordance with NFPA
72.

903.4.2.1 is added to read as follows:
903.4.2.1 Sprinkler Alarms: Approved combined audible/visual devices shall be connected to
every fire protection suppression system. Such alarm devices shall be activated by the systems
operation. Devices shall be located:

1. On the outside wall above each Fire Department Connection (Blue Lens)

2. On the outside wall above each main/unit entrance (Clear Lens)

3. Throughout all areas, and floors inside the building.
903.4.3.1 is added to read as follows:

903.4.3.1 Multiple Story Buildings: In multiple story buildings, provide floor control valves
with water flow switches for each floor. No birdcage systems are allowed.

903.4.3.2 is added to read as follows:

903.4.3.2 Floor Plan: A diagram showing area served by each system and/or control valves shall
be submitted. The same diagram shall be placed adjacent to the risers.

903.4.4 is added to read as follows:

903.4.4 Hydraulic Calculations: By each hydraulically calculated area, on each drawing,
provide a copy of the hydraulic nameplate.

903.4.5 is added to read as follow
903.4.5 Fire Pumps: All fire pumps shall have an outside test header. Provide an OS&Y gate
valve on all fire pump test headers. Provide a ball drip between the OS&Y control valve and the

outside test header. The test header shall have the minimum 2%” test valves required by NFPA
20.

18



903.5.1.1 is added to read as follows:

903.5.1.1 Inspectors Test Vales: Fire sprinkler system inspectors test valves shall be accessible
at all times and located no more than 6 feet above the finished floor. On multiple riser systems
test valves shall be marked as to which riser and area it tests and shall be located at the furthest
point of the system.

903.6 is amended to read as follows:

903.6 Where required in existing buildings and structures: An automatic sprinkler system
shall be provided in existing buildings and structures, in accordance with the provisions of
Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12, and Chapter 11.

903.6.1 is added to read as follows:

903.6.1 Additions: Additions to any building or structure equal to or exceeding fifty percent
(50%) of the gross floor area of the original building construction, as identified on the permit
records and construction drawings approved by the Village when the structure was first
constructed, shall require the installation of an approved automatic sprinkler system throughout
the entire existing and proposed building or structure in accordance with the provisions of
Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.12, and Chapter 11.

903.6.2 is added to read as follows:

903.6.2 High-Hazard Group H: Any change in Use and Occupancy which reclassifies a
building or structure or portion thereof to a High-Hazard Group H occupancy shall require the
installation of an approved automatic sprinkler system throughout the entire existing and
proposed building or structure in accordance with the provisions of Sections 903.2.1 through
903.2.12, and Chapter 11.

903.6.3 is added to read as follows:

903.6.3 Maintained in Operation: Approved automatic sprinkler systems in existing building
or structures shall be maintained in operational condition and shall be extended into any new
construction notwithstanding any change in use which could eliminate the need for sprinkler
protection.

SECTION 904
ALTERNATIVE AUTOMATIC FIRE-EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS

904.3.5 is amended to read as follows:

904.3.5 Monitoring: All automatic fire extinguishing systems shall be monitored by a fire alarm,
in a method approved by the Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72.

19



SECTION 905

STANDPIPE SYSTEMS
905.1 is amended to read as follows:

905.1 General: Standpipes required by this section shall be installed within one (1) floor of the
highest point of construction having secured decking as flooring.

905.2.1 is added to read as follows:

905.2.1 Standpipe System Design: standpipe systems in connection with an approved
hydraulically calculated sprinkler system shall maintain a minimum of 10% pressure cushion
between the seasonal low water supply and the total standpipe demand.

905.3.1 is amended to read as follows:

905.3.1 Height: Class I standpipe systems shall be installed throughout all buildings two (2) or
more stories in height. All standpipe systems shall be automatic wet systems.

905.3.1.1 is added to read as follows:

905.3.1.1 Building area: Class I standpipe systems shall be installed in all buildings where any
portion of the building's interior area is more than 150 feet of travel, vertically, and horizontally,
from the main entrance of the building of fire department vehicle access. Where the most remote

portion of a floor or story is more than 150 feet from a hose connection, the Fire Code Official
may require that additional hose connections be provided in approved locations.

905.3.1.2 is added to read as follows:

905.3.1.2: System Required: Buildings required by section 905.3 to be equipped with standpipe
systems shall be provided with a wet standpipe system that complies with section 905.3.1.

905.3.1.3 is added to read as follows:

905.3.1.3 High Rise Buildings: High rise building standpipes shall be designed for a minimum
65 psi to 100 psi at 500 gpm to the highest most remote standpipe outlet. Provide a minimum
250 gpm for each additional standpipe riser. The total shall not be required to exceed 1,250 gpm.
905.3.1.4 is added to read as follows:

905.3.1.4 Open Parking Structures: Detached open parking structures shall be provided with a
dry standpipe system without a connection to the public water main. Attached open parking

structures shall be provided with an automatic wet or automatic dry standpipe system.

905.13 is added to read as follows:

20



905.13 Pressure-Regulating Devices: Where residual pressure at any standpipe hose outlet
exceeds 100 psi approved pressure-regulating devices shall be installed at the outlets to limit the
pressure to 100 psi. Such devices shall regulate pressure under flow and no flow conditions. The
pressure on the inlet side of the pressure-regulating device shall not exceed the rated working
pressure of the device. All standpipe valves shall be Potter-Roemer, Inc. or equivalent
emergency field adjustable pressure restricting 2% angle valves, model 4085.

SECTION 906
PORTABLE FIRE EXTINGUISHERS

The exception to 906.1(1) is deleted.
906.3 is amended to read as follows:

906.3 Size and distribution: The minimum size fire extinguisher for use in all occupancy groups
shall be 4A60BC. All other applications shall be in accordance with the provisions of NFPA 10.

906.4.1.1 is added to read as follows:

906.4.1.1 Wet chemical fire suppression system: In areas with a wet chemical fire suppression
system shall have a minimum of one 6 (six) liter wet chemical potassium based fire extinguisher
within the kitchen area in addition to other required extinguishers. Additional extinguishers may
be required by the Fire Code Official.

906.5.1 is added to read as follows:

906.5.1 Location: Fire extinguishers shall be located within 5 feet of each exit door. All other
areas shall have fire extinguishers installed in accordance with NFPA 10.

SECTION 907
FIRE ALARM AND DETECTION SYSTEMS

907.1.4 is added to read as follows:

907.1.4 Underwriters laboratory certificates: All Fire Alarm systems installed within the
jurisdiction of the Village of Elk Grove Village shall be Underwriters Laboratory Certified as
Remote Station type systems. This Underwriters Laboratory certification shall remain in place for
as long as a fire alarm system is required to be installed in the property. This shall also include
those systems that monitor automatic sprinkler systems.

907.1.5 is added to read as follows:
907.1.5 Underwriters laboratory certificates existing systems: Any existing systems will be

required to be UL Certified within 5 years from the effective date of this ordinance. When an
occupancy changes, a UL Remote Station certificate will also be required. Where systems are

21



upgraded, a UL Remote Station is also required, this would include new control panels and changes
or additions to systems that are equal to or greater that 10% of the existing system.

907.1.6 is added to read as follows:

907.1.6 UL fire alarm installation requirements: In order to install a fire alarm system in the
Village of Elk Grove Village the installer must be a Licensed Fire Alarm Installer or a licensed
electrician. Prior to acceptance testing, the alarm contractor that will be issuing the certificate for
the Protected Property shall provide a current copy of the Alarm Contractor’s Certificate of
Compliance to the Village of Elk Grove Village’s Inspectional Services Division. A copy of the
Protected Property’s Remote Station UL Certificate shall be provided to the Village of EIk Grove
Village Inspectional Services Division upon completion of the acceptance test.

907.1.7 is added to read as follows:

907.1.7 Fire Alarm Control Panel Type: The fire alarm control panel shall be an addressable fire
alarm control panel capable of performing all necessary functions. The fire alarm control panel
shall be installed, in a method approved by the Fire Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72.

907.2 is amended to read as follows:

907.2 Where required-new buildings and structures: An approved manual, automatic or
manual and automatic fire alarm system installed and maintained in accordance with the provisions
of this code and NFPA 72 shall be provided in new buildings and structures in accordance with
Section 907.2.1 through 907.2.23 and provide occupant notification in accordance with section
907.10, unless other requirements are provided by another section of this code. All fire alarm
systems shall be an addressable type; and the fire alarm control panel or fully functional
annunciator panel with no pass codes shall be installed within 10’ of the main entrance or in a
location approved by the fire department. Multi-tenant buildings will be “ring by tenant” and shall
include a weatherproof clear outside strobe over the entrance to each tenant space as directed by
the Fire Code Official. All outside strobes shall be 75 candela minimum. Where automatic
sprinkler protection installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 is provided and
connected to the building fire alarm system, automatic heat detection required by this section shall
not be required. All fire alarm wiring for the systems shall be encased in RED electrical metallic
tubing (conduit).

907.2.1 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.1 Group A: A manual fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method approved by the Fire
Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in all Group A occupancies.

907.2.2 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.2 Group B: A manual fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method approved by the Fire
Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in Group B occupancies.

22



907.2.3 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.3 Group E: A manual fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method approved by the Fire
Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in Group E occupancies.

907.2.4 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.4 Group F: A manual fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method approved by the Fire
Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in Group F occupancies.

907.2.5 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.5 Group H: A manual fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method approved by the Fire
Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in Group H occupancies.

907.2.6 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.6 Group I: A manual fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method approved by the Fire
Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in Group I-1 occupancies.

Exception 1 to 907.2.6.1 is deleted.
907.2.6.2 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.6.2 Group 1-2: A manual fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method approved by the
Fire Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in Group I-2 occupancies.

907.2.6.3 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.6.3 Group 1-3: A manual fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method approved by the
Fire Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in Group I-3 occupancies.

907.2.7 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.7 Group M: A manual fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method approved by the
Fire Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in Group M.

907.2.8 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.8 Group R-1: A manual fire alarm system and an automatic fire detection system shall be
installed, in a method approved by the Fire Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in all Group
R-1 occupancies.

907.2.9 is amended to read as follows:

23



907.2.9 Group R-2: An automatic fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method approved by
the Fire Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in all Group R-2 occupancies.

907.2.10 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.10 Group R-4: An automatic fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method approved by
the Fire Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in all Group R-4 occupancies.

907.2.10.1.1 is added to read as follows:

907.2.10.1.1 Additional Detection: Heat detectors with audible devices shall be provided in all
attached garages with residential occupancies. The heat detector shall transmit a signal to all
other detection devices and all devices shall go into alarm with an audible signal.

907.2.11.2 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.11.2 Group I-1: Single or multiple-station smoke alarms shall be installed and maintained
in sleeping areas in occupancies in Group I-1.

907.2.11.2.1 is added to read as follows:
907.2.11.2.1 Group S: A manual fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method approved by the
Fire Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in Group S occupancies.

907.2.11.2.2 is added to read as follows:

907.2.11.2.2 Group U: A manual fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method approved by
the Fire Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in Group S occupancies.

907.2.12 is amended to read as follows:

907.2.12 High-rise buildings: Buildings with a floor used for human occupancy located more
than 60 feet above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access shall be provided with an
automatic fire alarm system, pressurized stairwells, fire command center, fire department
communication center and an emergency voice/alarm communication system in accordance with
Section 907.2.12.2

907.2.24 is added to read as follows:

907.2.24 Senior Citizen Housing: A manual fire alarm system shall be installed, in a method
approved by the Code Official in accordance with NFPA 72 in all Senior Citizen Housing
occupancies as defined in the Village of Elk Grove Village Zoning Ordinance.

907.3.1 is amended to read as follows:

907.3.1 Duct smoke detectors: Duct smoke detectors shall be connected to the building’s fire
alarm control panel when a fire alarm system is provided. Activation of a duct smoke detector

24



shall initiate a visible and audible fire signal and shut down the individual units. Duct smoke
detectors shall not be used as a substitute for required open area detection. Duct smoke detectors
shall be required in all air handling units 2000 CFM or greater. All test switches shall be labeled
and installed in a proximate area near the Fire Alarm panel or as determined by the Fire Code
Official. All duct detectors should be labeled in correlation with the HVAC units and clearly
marked on the inside ceiling, visible from the floor. All rooftop units will be visibly marked from
the roof/scuttle access point.

907.3.3.1 is added to read as follows:

907.3.3.1 Elevator emergency telephones: Elevator emergency telephones shall be connected
to the Village of Elk Grove Village Communications Center.

907.6.2 is amended to read as follows:

907.6.2 Power supply: The primary and secondary power supply for the fire alarm shall be
provided in accordance with NFPA 72. The secondary supply shall be equipped with a 60 hour
battery.

907.6.4 is amended to read as follows:

907.6.4 Zones: Each floor shall be zoned separately and a zone shall not exceed 10,000 square
feet. The length of any zone shall not exceed 200 feet in any direction; a zoning indicator panel
and the associated controls shall be provided in an approved location. The visual zone indication
shall lock in until the system is reset and shall not be cancelled by the operation of a public alarm
silencing switch. A separate zone by floor shall be provided for the following types of alarm
initiating devices where provided:

A. Detection devices.

B. Sprinkler water flow alarms.

C. Manual fire alarm boxes.

D. Each tenant space in multi tenant occupancies, and

E. Other approved type of automatic fire detection devices or suppression systems.

907.6.5.1 is added to read as follows:

907.6.5.1 FACP Access: The fire alarm panel capable of performing all necessary functions
shall be easily accessible and visibly located within the sprinkler riser room and/or fire pump
room or in a method approved by the Fire Code Official.

907.6.5.2 is added to read as follows:

907.6.5.2 FAAP Access: The fire alarm annunciator panel capable of performing all necessary
functions shall be easily accessible and visibly located within ten feet (10" from the entrance into
the building and/or unit.

907.6.5.3 is added to read as follows:

907.6.5.3 FACP / FAAP Instructions: All new and existing fire alarm control panels shall be
provided with written operating instructions to perform the necessary features of the fire alarm

25



panel. The operating instructions, a complete fire alarm zone map, and other applicable
information shall be framed and mounted within one foot (1) of the fire alarm control panels.
Building contact phone numbers shall be provided inside the alarm panel.

907.8.6 is added to read as follows:

907.8.6 Records of completion: A record of completion in accordance with NFPA 72 verifying
that the system has been installed with the approved plans and specifications shall be provided. A
schematic minimum of and 8.5 by 11 inch or, in a method approved by the Fire Code Official shall
be provided showing all devices and components of the alarm system.

907.9 is amended to read as follows:

907.9 Where required in existing buildings and structures: All existing commercial and multi-
tenant occupancy structures within the Village of Elk Grove Village shall have an approved
working fire alarm system which is monitored, in a method approved by the Fire Code Official in
accordance with NFPA 72. The master fire alarm panel in facilities/buildings that are rented or
leased are the responsibility of the building owner to maintain and service. Any building that is
modified, vacant more than 30 days, or were change of use and/or occupancy occurs shall comply
with this requirement before any use of occupancy will be granted. All requirements shall comply
with section 907.2.

907.11 is added to read as follows:

907.11 Non-required systems: AIll non-required systems which are supervised shall use
equipment listed for that particular fire alarm system. Non-required systems shall be installed in
accordance with Section 907 and/or, in a method approved by the Fire Code Official in accordance
with NFPA 72. Non-required systems shall be maintained in good working order.

SECTION 908
EMERGENCY ALARM SYSTEMS

908.1 is amended to read as follows:

908.1 Group H Occupancies: Emergency alarms for the detection and notification of an
emergency condition in Group H occupancies shall be provided as required in Chapter 27. All
required alarms shall be directly connected, in a method approved by the Fire Code Official in
accordance to provisions of NFPA 72.
SECTION 909
SMOKE CONTROL SYSTEMS
909.20.7 is added to read as follows:

909.20.7 In garage settings where a carbon monoxide detection device controls the activation of
an exhaust system this system must shut down upon the activation the fire detection and/or

26



suppression systems. This will have a manual override control which will be installed under
direction of the Fire Code Official.

909.20.7.1 is added to read as follows:

909.20.7.1 This system is subject to acceptance and testing by the Fire Code Official.

SECTION 912
FIRE DEPARTMENT CONNECTIONS

912.1.1 is added to read as follows:

912.1.1 Arrangement: Fire Department connections shall be arranged in such a manner that the
use of any one water sprinkler connection will serve all sprinklers, and the use of any one
standpipe will serve all standpipes within the building.

912.1.2 is added to read as follows:

912.1.2 Storz connection: The location of the fire department connection shall be approved by
the Fire Code Official. The fire department connection shall consist of one five inch Storz
coupling on a 30 degree elbow downturn mounted between 36 inches and 48 inches above the
finished floor.

912.1.3 is added to read as follows:

912.1.3 Footprint: For the purpose of this section, the term “building” will be interpreted to
mean the footprint of the entire structure encompassing the entire area within the outside limits
of the exterior walls, roof, or architectural trim of the structure.

912.1.4 is added to read as follows:

912.1.4 Firewalls: Firewalls or other separations walls shall not be considered an exterior wall
for the purpose of interpreting this section.

912.2 is amended to read as follows:

912.2 Location: With respect to hydrants, driveways, buildings and landscaping, fire department
connections shall be so located that fire apparatus and hose connected to supply the system will
not obstruct access to the buildings for other fire apparatus. Fire department connections shall be
located within 50 feet of a fire hydrant at a location approved by the code official. Fire Department
connections shall be located where they will be visible from the public street or other location
approved by the Fire Department. They shall be located so that immediate access can be made by
the Fire Department. Fire Department connections shall not be obstructed by fences, bushes, trees,
walls or similar objects. A ten-inch (10”) water flow alarm bell and blue illuminated identification
device shall be located above the connection. A six-inch (6””) water flow alarm bell shall be located
inside the building by the sprinkler riser.

27



912.6 is amended to read as follows:

912.6 Backflow protection: The potable water supply to automatic sprinkler and standpipe
systems shall be protected against backflow as required by the International Plumbing Code and
The Illinois Plumbing Code.

SECTION 913
FIRE PUMPS
913.1.1 is added to read as follows:

913.1.1 Fire Pump Access: Where provided, rooms containing fire pumps shall be separated
from the remainder portions of the building by a minimum of two (2) hour construction. Fire
pump room access shall be located on the main level of discharge. Access to the fire pump shall
be from both the exterior and interior of the building.

913.4 is amended to read as follows:

913.4 Valve supervision: Where provided, the fire pump suction, discharge and bypass valves,
and the isolation valves on the backflow prevention device or assembly shall be supervised by a
fire alarm system directly connected, in a method approved by the Code Official in accordance
with the provisions of NFPA 72,

SECTION 914

FIRE PROTECTION BASED ON SPECIAL DETAILED
REQUIREMENTS OF USE AND OCCUPANCY

The exception to 914.2.1(2) is deleted.
The exceptions to 914.3.1 are deleted.
The exceptions to 914.4.1 are deleted.

The exception to 914.7.1 is deleted.

SECTION 1003
GENERAL MEANS OF EGRESS

1003.1 is amended to read as follows:
1003.1 Applicability: The general requirements specified in this section shall apply to all three

elements of the means of egress system, in addition to those specific requirements for the exit
access, the exit and the exit discharge detailed elsewhere in this chapter. The provisions of the

28



International EXxisting Building Code 2018 shall not be used to eliminate the installation
requirements for exit signs and means of egress illumination systems.

SECTION 1008
MEANS OF EGRESS ILLUMINATION

The exceptions to 1008.2 is deleted.
1008.3 is amended to read as follows:

1008.3 Emergency power for illumination. The power supply for means of egress illumination
shall normally be provided by the premise's electrical supply.

In the event of power supply failure, an emergency system shall automatically illuminate all of the
following areas:

1. Exit access corridors, passageways, and aisles in rooms and spaces, which require two
or more means of egress.

2. Exit access corridors and exit stairways located in buildings required to have two or
more exits.

3. Interior exit discharge elements, as permitted in Section 1008.1, in buildings required
to have two or more exits.

4. The portion of the exterior exit discharge immediately adjacent to exit discharge
doorways in buildings required to have two or more exits.

5. Conference rooms, training rooms, break or lunch rooms, and restrooms that
accommodate more than one occupant.

SECTION 1009
ACCESSIBLE MEANS OF EGRESS
The exceptions to 1009.2.1 are deleted.
The exceptions to 1009.3.2 are deleted.
The exceptions to 1009.3.3 are deleted.
SECTION 1010
DOORS, GATES AND TURNSTILES

The exceptions to 1010.1.1 are deleted.

29



1010.1.9.4 is amended to read as follows:

1010.1.9.4 LOCKS AND LATCHES. Egress doors shall be readily open able from the egress
side without the use of a key or special knowledge or effort.

Exceptions:
1. Places of detention or restraint.

2. Where approved by the code official, a readily visible durable sign is posted on the
egress side on or adjacent to the door stating: THIS DOOR TO REMAIN
UNLOCKED WHEN BUILDING IS OCCUPIED. This sign shall be in letters 1 inch
(25 mm) high on a contrasting background.

3. Where egress doors are used in pairs, approved automatic flush bolts shall be permitted
to be used, provided that the door leaf having the automatic flush bolts has no doorknob
or surface mounted hardware. The unlatching of any leaf shall not require more than
one operation.

4. Doors from individual dwelling units and guestrooms of Group R occupancies having
an occupant load of 10 or less are permitted to be equipped with a night latch, dead bolt
or security chain, provided such devices are accessible from the inside without the use
of a key or tool.

SECTION 1013
EXIT SIGNS

Exception 2 to 1013.1 is deleted.
1013.1.2 is added to read as follows:

1013.1.2 Floor proximity exit signs. The installation of low-level exit signs to supplement regular
exit signs shall be placed in all new occupancies to include places of assembly, hotels, department
stores, or other buildings subject to transient occupancy and semi-permanent occupancy such as
an apartment house, and as deemed necessary by the Fire Code Official. Such exit signs may be
approved luminescent, photo luminescent, self-luminous, or self-illuminated types. They are not
intended to replace standard exit signs but are designed as a supplementary aid for a building
occupant seeking egress in smoke-filled environment at a location that is the last to become
obscured. Existing facilities shall be required to have this signage within 2 years.

Such signs shall be located near the floor level in addition to those signs required for doors or

corridors. The bottom of the sign shall be not less than six (6) inches, but not more that eighteen
(18) inches above the floor. For exit doors, the sign shall be mounted on or adjacent to the door

30



with the nearest edge of the sign within four (4) inches of the door frame. Photo luminescent
signs may be used in place of externally illuminated signs.

1013.1.3 is added to read as follows:

1013.1.3 Floor and stairwell signs. Floor and stairwell signs shall be required in all stairwells in
every floor in all new construction and all existing hotels and nursing homes. Signs shall also be
mounted on the wall adjacent to the door at five (5) foot above finished floor indicating floor level
and stairwell designation.

1013.1.4 is added to read as follows:

1013.1.4 Floor proximity egress path marking. Floor proximity exits signs are required in all
use groups/occupancies as determined by the Fire Code Official. Listed and approved floor
proximity egress path marking that is internally illuminated shall be installed within eighteen (18)
of the floor. The system shall provide a visible delineation of the path of travel along the
designated exit access and shall be essentially continuous, except as interrupted by doorways,
hallways, corridors, or other such architectural features. The system shall operate continuously or
anytime the fire alarm system is activated. Photo-luminescent path marking may be used in place
of internally illuminated path markings.

1013.3 is amended to read as follows:

1013.3 Hlumination: Exit signs should be internally, externally or photo luminescent illuminated.

SECTION 1015
GUARDS

Exception 6 to 1015.1 is deleted.
SECTION 1028

EXIT DISCHARGE

1028.5 is amended to read as follows:

1028.5 Access to public way: From each grade floor exit from a building there shall be provided
a hard surface area, a minimum of forty-eight inches (48”) in width centered on that door,
extending from the door to a property line adjoining a public street.

SECTION 1106
REQUIREMENTS FOR OUTDOOR OPERATIONS

1106.2 is added to read as follows:

31



1106.2 Barrier protection/containment. Physical barriers shall consist of IDOT certified
concrete barriers. Barriers shall be provided to protect the area where construction type fuel tanks
are established. Containment will also be provided to contain 110% of the largest tanks capacity.

SECTION 1204
SOLAR PHOTOVOLTAIC POWER SYSTEMS

1204.1.1 is added to read as follows:
1204.1.1. Rapid Shutdown. Solar photovoltaic power systems shall be provided with a rapid

shutdown function in accordance with NFPA 70. The location(s) of the rapid shutdown controls
shall be in a method approved by the Code Official .

SECTION 2404
SPRAY FINISHING

The exceptions to 2404.2 are deleted.

SECTION 3104
TEMPORARY AND PERMANENT TENTS AND MEMBRANE STRUCTURES

3104.2.1 is added to read as follows:

3104.2.1 Outdoor Assembly Event Tents or Membrane Structures. All Tents or Membrane
Structures no matter its size shall comply with Section 3104.2.

SECTION 3105
TEMPORARY SPECIAL EVENT STRUCTURES

3105.9 is amended to read as follows:
3105.9 Portable fire extinguishers. Portable fire extinguishers shall be a 4A60BC extinguisher.
SECTION 3106
OUTDOOR ASSEMBLY EVENT

3106.3.3 is added to read as follows:

3106.3.3 Occupant load sign. A Sign with maximum occupant load must be prominently posted
at the main entrance at all times.

SECTION 3317
SAFEGUARDING ROOFING OPERATIONS

32



3317.3 is amended to read as follows:

3317.3 Fire Extinguishers for roofing operations: Fire extinguishers shall be installed in
accordance with section 906. There shall be not less than one multi- purpose portable fire
extinguisher with a minimum 4A60BC on the roof being covered or repaired.

SECTION 5001
HAZARDOUS MATERIALS - GENERAL PROVISIONS

5001.3.3.1 is amended to read as follows:

5001.3.3.1 Properties of hazardous materials. All buildings, and/or tenant spaces containing
hazardous materials shall provide a Knox box document storage cabinet for placement of the
MSDS sheets. The box shall be large enough to accommodate all information. It shall be mounted
at 5 (five) feet above the finished floor, and shall be located in a spot that is approved by the Fire
Code Official.

SECTION 5601
EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS - GENERAL

Exceptions 2 and 4 to 5601.1.3 are deleted.
Exception 5 to 5601.1.3 is added to read as follows:

5. Consumer Novelties. The retail sale of approved consumer novelties shall be permitted.
Retail sales of consumer novelties shall be permitted in stores equipped with approved automatic
sprinkler systems. Displays of consumer novelties in retail stores shall be separated from exit
doors by a minimum distance of twenty (20) feet. The sale of consumer novelties shall not be
permitted at mercantile occupancies that sell or dispense flammable or combustible liquids or
gases. Purchase of consumer novelties shall be restricted to those persons who are eighteen (18)
years of age or older. Approved consumer novelties include snakes or glow worm pellets, smoke
devices, trick noisemakers known as party poppers, booby traps, snappers, trick matches, cigarette
loads, auto burglar alarms, toy pistols, toy canes, toy guns, or other devices in which paper or
plastic caps containing twenty-five hundredths grains or less of explosive compound are used,
provided they are so constructed that the hand cannot come in contact with the cap when in place
for the explosion; and toy pistol paper or plastic caps which contain less than twenty-five (25)
hundredths grains of explosive mixture, the sale and use of which shall permitted at all times

SECTION 3302
EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS - DEFINITIONS

Fireworks, 1.4G is amended to read as follows:

33



Fireworks, 1.4G (Formerly known as Class C, Common Fireworks.) Small fireworks devices
including hand-held wire sparklers containing restricted amounts of pyrotechnic composition
designed primarily to produce visible or audible effects by combustion. Such 1.4G fireworks
which comply with the construction, chemical composition and labeling regulations of the DOT
for Fireworks, UN 0336, and the U.S. Consumer Product Safety Commission as set forth in CPSC
16 CFR: Parts 1500 and 1507 are not explosive materials for the purpose of this code.

SECTION 5608
FIREWORKS DISPLAY

5608.1 is amended to read as follows:

5608.1 General. The display of fireworks, including proximate audience displays and pyrotechnic
special effects in motion picture, television, theatrical, and group entertainment productions, shall
comply with this chapter, Office of the Sate Fire Marshal, and 2018 edition of NFPA 1123 and/or
2016 edition of NFPA 1126.

5608.1.1 is added to read as follows:

5608.1.1 General requirements for all pyrotechnic/consumer fireworks displays. All
pyrotechnic fireworks displays shall conform to the Fireworks Use Act (425 ILCS 35).

5608.2.1 is amended to read as follows:

5608.2.1 Outdoor displays. In addition to the requirements of Section 403 permit application for
outdoor fireworks shall include a diagram of the location at which the display will be conducted
including the site from which fireworks will be discharged; the location of buildings, highways,
overhead obstructions and utilities; and the lines behind which the audience will be restrained. All
outdoor fireworks displays shall be electronically fired from an approved electronic firing unit.

5608.3.1 is added to read as follows:

5608.3.1 Pyrotechnic operator and licensing rules. Any person, company, entity, association, or
corporation who distributes, provides display services or supervises a pyrotechnic display within
the Village of Elk Grove Village must be licensed according to the Pyrotechnic Distributor and
Operator Licensing Act (2251LCS 227).

5608.8.1 is added to read as follows:

5608.8.1 Fire department supervision of displays. All outside public fireworks displays are
required to have a fire department standby, to be determined by the fire chief or his/her designee.
Fire department expenses incurred by this standby will be billed to the host of the display. Local
governmental agencies may be exempt from this fee.

5608.11 is added to read as follows:

34



5608.11 Retail display and sale. It shall be unlawful to sell, store, or advertise for sale, Division
1.4G, 1.3G & 1.4S fireworks within the boundaries of the Village of EIk Grove Village.

5608.12 is added to read as follows:

5608.12 Consumer fireworks. Consumer fireworks (1.4G) as defined by the Fireworks Use Act
(445 ILCS 35) shall not be manufactured, stored, sold retail or wholesale or utilized within the
boundaries of the Village of Elk Grove Village along with the following unregulated items:
sparklers of all sizes and types and smoke devices.

SECTION 3309
TEMPORARY STORAGE OF CONSUMER FIREWORKS

3309.1 is deleted.

Appendices A, B, C, E, F and G are deleted.
Appendix O is added to read as follows:
APPENDIX O

BASIC FIRE CONTROL MEASURES

A-101.1 Scope: Adoption of fire control measures and regulations. There has been adopted by
the Village of Elk Grove Village fire control measures and regulations as herein set forth for the
purposes of controlling conditions which could impede or interfere with fire suppression forces.

A-102.1 Authority at Fires and Other Emergencies: The Fire Official or duly authorized
representatives, as may be in charge at the scene of a fire or emergency involving the protection
of life and property, is empowered to direct such operations as may be necessary to extinguish or
control any suspected or reported fires, gas leaks or other hazardous conditions or situations or of
taking any other action necessary in the reasonable performance of their duty. The Fire Official
may prohibit any person, vehicle or object from approaching the scene and may remove or cause
to be removed from the scene any person, vehicle, or object which may impede or interfere with
the operations of the fire department. The Fire Official may remove or cause to be removed any
person, vehicle or object from the hazardous areas. All persons ordered to leave a hazardous area
shall do so immediately and shall not re-enter the area until authorized to do so by the Fire Official.

A-103.1 Interference with Fire Village Operations: It shall be unlawful to interfere with, attempt
to interfere with, conspire to interfere with, obstruct or restrict the mobility of or block the path of
travel of any fire department emergency vehicle in any way, or to interfere with, attempt to
interfere with, obstruct or hamper any fire department operation.

A-104.1 Compliance with Orders: A person shall not willfully fail or refuse to comply with any

lawful order or direction of the Fire Chief or to interfere with the compliance attempts of another
individual.

35



A-105.1 Vehicles Crossing Fire Hose: A vehicle shall not be driven or propelled over any
unprotected fire hose of the fire department when laid down on any street, alleyway, private drive
or any other vehicular roadway without the consent of the Fire Code Official in command of said
operation.

A-106.1 Definition of Emergency Vehicle: Authorized emergency vehicles shall be restricted to
those which are defined and authorized under the laws of the State of Illinois.

A-107.1 Operation Of Vehicles on Approach of Authorized Emergency Vehicles: Upon the
approach of any authorized emergency vehicle, giving audible and visual signal, the operator of
every other vehicle shall immediately drive the same to a position as near as possible and parallel
to the right-hand edge or curb of the street or roadway, clear of any intersection and shall stop and
remain in such position until the authorized emergency vehicle or vehicles shall have passed,
unless otherwise directed by the Fire Official or a police officer.

A-108.1 Vehicles Following Fire Apparatus: It shall be unlawful for the operator of any vehicle
other than one on official business, to follow closer than 300 feet from any fire apparatus traveling
in response to a fire alarm or to drive any vehicle within the block or immediate area where fire
apparatus has stopped in answer to a fire alarm

A-109.1 Unlawful Boarding or Tampering With Fire Village Emergency Equipment: A
person shall not without proper authorization from the Fire Official in charge of said fire
department emergency equipment, cling to, attach himself to, climb upon or into, board or swing
upon any fire department emergency vehicle, whether the same is in motion or at rest, or sound
the siren, horn, bell or other sound-producing device thereon, or to manipulate or tamper with, or
attempt to manipulate or tamper with any levers, valves, switches, starting devices, brakes pumps
or other equipment.

A-110.1 Damage, Injury-Fire Department Equipment, and Personnel: It shall be unlawful for
any person to damage or deface, or attempt or conspire to damage or deface, any fire department
emergency vehicle at any time or to injure, or attempt or conspire to injure, fire department
personnel while performing departmental duties.

A-112.1 Blocking Fire Hydrants and Fire Department Connections: It shall be unlawful to
obscure from view, damage, deface, obstruct or restrict the access to any fire hydrant or any fire
department connection for the pressurization of fire suppression systems, including fire hydrants
and fire department connections located on public or private streets and access lanes or on private
property. All vehicles blocking fire hydrants and fire department connections shall be moved
immediately.

36



Appendix P is added to read as follows:
APPENDIX P

VILLAGE OF ELK GROVE VILLAGE
FIRE ALARM PLAN SUBMITTAL CHECKLIST

This checklist is an effort to help provide a uniform approach for the design community and to
provide owners and fire alarm designers with complete fire alarm design and submittal package
requirements.

When submitting plans for review all plan submittals must include this Fire Alarm Plan
Submittal Checklist or they will not be accepted. By completing this checklist and including all
of the necessary information requested it is the intent of this document to provide efficient and
appropriate turnaround of the plans submitted. It is the responsibility of the installer/designer to
assure that all applicable code requirements are followed. (Check with the Village Code to find
the current standards.)

The installation, renovation, addition, and/or maintenance of any fire alarm system shall comply
with the following:

IMPORTANT:

No installation work shall be performed until the plans have been reviewed and approved.
Expect up to 10 working days for plan reviews per submittal

CHECKLIST: (All plans submitted must contain the following)

0 Proof of Contractor’s license to be able to work within the village limits. (UL Certified)
0 Must be certified electrician to install Fire Alarm System, must be licensed to install Fire
Alarm Systems.

FIRE ALARM DRAWINGS:

0 Must submit Fire Alarm drawings to the Village of Elk Grove Village, Inspectional
Services Division, 901 Wellington, Elk Grove Village, 1l 60007. Any questions please
contact the Division at 847-734-8020

0 Must submit four (4) complete sets of fire alarm drawings, or two (2) on USB Flash
drive in PDF format, and cut sheet/product information. The scaled drawings must
include the following:

e Title block to include the following information: Property name and
address, Alarm Company name and address, date of drawing with
space for revision dates, classification of the system per NFPA 72
1.3.1, who drew the drawing, the scale of the drawing, label the

37



drawing as Fire Alarm System Standard or Addressable, Number of
pages of the drawing.

e A legend of Fire Alarm System located on one sheet to indicate the
type of device installed.

e A point-to-point wire diagram indicating the number of wires and
gauge for each wire run. Include EMT size when appropriate.
Include a statement in the installation notes under the symbols
legend indicating the type of wire and gauge for each circuit.

e An on line and riser diagram for all devices, notification circuits,
auxiliary circuits, initiating circuits, and circuit designation.

e Include overall dimension of the building on each floor and square
footage. Ceiling heights and ceiling construction must be identified
on the drawings.

o Drawings need to be clear, legible and understandable. Drawings must be of a fire alarm
design only.

CALCULATIONS
o0 Wire size, type, and resistance value
o0 Voltage drop calculations
0 Battery calculations (minimum 60 hour battery back up)

SPECIFICATION SHEETS
All pertinent information shall be highlighted on the sheet. Please provide cut sheets for all
devices installed.

FACP - Type, Listing, Current Draw

Batteries — Type, Listing, Current Draw

Smoke Detector — Type, Configuration, Spacing, Current Draw
Heat Detector — Type, Configuration, Spacing, Current Draw
Shunt Trip Heat Detector — Type, Rating, RTI-elevators

Duct Detectors — Switch located on Fire Alarm panel (reset stations need to be located near
the panel)

Manual Pull Stations — Type, Configuration

Audible Appliances — Type, Rating, Power Tap

Alarm Temporal Pattern

Visual Appliances — Type, Configuration

Protective Covers — Type, Attenuation

Water Flow Devices — Type, Configuration

Supervisory Device — Type, Configuration

Synchronization Module — Type, Current Draw

Sequence of operation

Class and Style of Signaling Line Circuits

Class and Style of Notification Appliance Circuits

O O0O0O00O0

OO0OO0O0O0O00O0O0OO0OO0ODO

38



ADDITIONAL SUBMITTAL INFORMATION REQUIRED

UL listed Remote station (Northwest Central Dispatch)

Graphic Map with initiating device locations

Measured or ambient sound levels used

Alarm signal devices shall produce a sound that exceeds the Average Ambient Sound Level
Table (NFPA Standard 72)

A Record of Completion — shall be prepared and submitted at final inspection (Record of
completion can be found in Section 1-6.2 in NFPA 72)

0 A stamped set of plans and cut sheets approved by the Fire Village shall be available at the
work-site at all times.

O 00O

@]

ROUGH INSPECTION

A rough inspection of all fire alarm wiring shall be done by the Village of Elk Grove Village
Inspectional Services Division prior to the installation of drywall and/or ceiling materials.

FINAL INSPECTION

No acceptance testing will be conducted prior to completion of construction. A minimum of 2
working days is needed to schedule test.

Final acceptance is subject to Field Inspection.

An appointment is needed to be scheduled to have the final inspection completed. No testing will
occur until all communicators are operational and being monitored.

The contractor must provide the Village of ElIk Grove Village Inspectional Services Division
with a certificate stating that the fire protection systems are installed in full compliance with
NFPA standards, IBC/IFC requirements, and that all acceptance tests have been conducted. This
certificate must be presented to the Fire Inspector at the time of the final acceptance test for the
system.

The contractor must also supply a NFPA 72 worksheet at the time of the fire alarm acceptance
test.

39



Appendix Q is added to read as follows:
APPENDIX Q

VILLAGE OF ELK GROVE VILLAGE
SPRINKLER SYSTEM PLAN
SUBMITTAL CHECKLIST

This checklist is an effort to help provide a uniform approach for the design community and to
provide owners and sprinkler system designers with complete sprinkler system design and
submittal package requirements.

When submitting plans for review all plan submittals must include this Sprinkler System Plan
Submittal Checklist or they will not be accepted. By completing this checklist and including all
of the necessary information requested it is the intent of this document to provide efficient and
appropriate turnaround of the plans submitted. It is the responsibility of the installer/designer to
assure that all applicable code requirements are followed. (Check with the Village Code to find
the current standards.)

The installation, renovation, addition, and/or maintenance of any sprinkler system shall comply
with the following:

IMPORTANT:

No installation work shall be performed until the plans have been reviewed and approved.
Expect up to 10 working days for plan reviews per submittal

CHECKLIST: (All plans submitted must contain the following)

o0 Proof of Contractor’s license to be able to work within the village limits.
0 Must be licensed to install Sprinkler Systems with the Illinois Office of the State Fire
Marshal.

SPRINKLER SYSTEM DRAWINGS:

0 -Must submit Sprinkler System drawings to the Village of ElIk Grove Village, Inspectional
Services Division, 901 Wellington, Elk Grove Village, 1l 60007. Any questions please
contact the Division at 847-734-8020.

0 Must submit four (4) complete sets of sprinkler systems drawings or two (2) on USB
Flash drive in PDF format and cut sheet/product information. The scaled drawings must
include the following:

e Title block to include the following information: Property name and address,
Sprinkler company name/Contractor name, address and phone number, date of
drawing with space for revision dates, classification of the system per NFPA 13, who
drew the drawing, and a detailed scope of work.

e All hydraulic node points shall be shown clearly on the drawing.

e The specific type and quantity of sprinklers shall be provided on every page.

40



e All ceiling information including soffits, heights, construction type, slope, etc. shall
be shown and noted with cross section detailed on the plans

e Specific code sections and storage information shall be provided for all design
densities over an Ordinary Group Il

e Provide a scaled site plan clearly showing the building fire department connection
location and fire hydrant locations.

Drawings need to be clear, legible and understandable. Drawings must be of a sprinkler system
design only.

CALCULATIONS

0 Hydraulic calculations shall clearly show the friction loss for the backflow preventer and
include a graph curve sheet
o0 Fire hydrant flow test information shall be dated and less than one (1) year old.

SPECIFICATION SHEETS
All pertinent information shall be highlighted on the sheet. Please provide cut sheets for all
devices installed.

o All sprinklers, valves, etc shall be included on the cut sheets.

ROUGH INSPECTION

A rough inspection of all sprinkler piping shall be done by the Village of Elk Grove Village
Inspectional Services Division prior to the installation of drywall and/or ceiling materials.

TESTS

A flush of the underground water mains must be made prior to the connection to the sprinkler
system. All tests must be witnessed by the Village of Elk Grove Village Inspectional Services
Division.

All underground and overhead systems and piping should be hydrostatically tested with water at
not less than 200 psi for two hours. This test must be witnessed by the Village of Elk Grove
Village Inspectional Services Division.

When the system is complete a 2 inch main drain test must be completed and must be witnessed
by the Village of Elk Grove Village Inspectional Services Division.

When the system is completed a wet system inspectors test must be completed and the inspectors
test report must be provided to the Village of Elk Grove Village Inspectional Services Division.

41



FINAL INSPECTION

No acceptance testing will be conducted prior to completion of construction. A minimum of 2
working days is needed to schedule test.

Final acceptance is subject to Field Inspection.
An appointment is needed to be scheduled to have the final inspection completed.
The contractor must provide the Village of EIk Grove Village Inspectional Services Division with
a certificate stating that the fire protection systems are installed in full compliance with NFPA
standards, IBC/IFC requirements, and that all acceptance tests have been conducted. This
certificate must be presented to the Fire Inspector at the time of the final hydrostatic/acceptance
test.
Appendix R is added to read as follows:
APPENDIX R

VILLAGE OF ELK GROVE VILLAGE

WRITTEN REQUEST FOR RECORDS
Dear Chief (or designee):

(D, (We), are hereby requesting that (I), (We)

Inspect the following records at the Village of EIk Grove Village Administration

Office

Receive copies of the following records from the Village of ElIk Grove
Village
(Please be specific in listing records) DATE AND LOCATION

Fire Report Hazardous Spills Car Fire Other

All REQUESTS for ambulance reports must be accompanied by an ORIGINAL FORM
SIGNED BY THE PATIENT. Requests for fire reports must bear the original signature of
the insured.

42



Date of Request Print Name

Signature (s) of Requester (s)

Address
Phone #
(Office Use Only)
Date Request Received
Signature

Attachment A is added to read as follows:
Attachment A

REFERENCED APPENDIX, CODES, AND STANDARDS: The appendixes, codes, and
standards referenced in this code shall be those that are listed in Chapter 80 and such codes and
standards shall be considered part of the requirements of this code to the prescribed extent of each
such reference. Where differences occur between the provisions of this code and the referenced
standards, the most stringent provision shall apply.

The following codes and editions listed are to be adopted in their entirety:

International Building Code 2018
International Existing Building Code 2018

NFPA 10 2018
13 2016
13R 2016
13D 2016
14 2016
15 2017
16 2015
20 2016
24 2016
25 2017
70 2017
72 2016
96 2017

1123 2018
1124 2017

43



Attachment B is added to read as follows:

Attachment B FEES

Open Burning

Resident Commercial

1% Violation — Warning 1 Violation - Warning

2" Violation - $50.00 2" Violation - $50.00 - $150.00
3" Violation - $100.00 3" Violation - $150.00 - $300.00

Fire watch: A fee of $75.00 per hour for each Village of Elk Grove Village personnel assigned
to the fire watch shall be charged. A minimum of 2 personal required.

Command Vehicle $100.00 per hour
Engine $100.00 per hour
Truck $100.00 per hour
Specialized Equip. $100.00 per hour

Emergency Access Maintenance:

It shall be the responsibility of every property owner and/or manager to provide current telephone
numbers, current insurance information and contact persons to be notified in case of emergency
involving their property and/or building. Changes should be made in writing and sent or faxed to
the Village of Elk Grove Village.

If a business changes locks, they must notify the Inspectional Services Division and get new keys
for the Knox box. If the Fire Department responds and the keys in the box are not valid the business
may be fined.

Definitions:

False alarm is an alarm signal which indicated the existence of an emergency situation, when in
fact no emergency exists, and shall include any alarm signal generated by any fire protection
system by whatever means, but shall not include the following causes:

e Fire causing structural damage to the protected premises verified by the Village of Elk
Grove Village Inspectional Services Division.

e Earthquakes causing structural damage to the protected premises.

e At the Fire Code Officials discretion.

Vendor Meet: A meeting between the representatives from the Fire alarm Company, Fire Village,

Transmitting agency, Receiving Agency, and Building owner to resolve an ongoing alarm issue.
The Building Owner will be responsible for all fees incurred during the meeting.

44



Limited Service Alarms: Any time an alarm is taken from a full service status due to a problem
with alarm, alarm still able to send Fire Signals.

Out of Service Alarm: Any alarm that is taken out of service due to some type of malfunction
causing the alarm to not transmit signals properly. Business placed on a 911 call in response only.
Some businesses may require a Fire Watch.

False Alarm Fees:
The fees pertaining to False Alarms will be charged in accordance with the Village of Elk Grove
Village Activated Fire Alarm (AFA) Investigation Report.

Out of Service Alarms:

The failure of any person to comply with the requirements contained in a written notice of a
malfunction of equipment within three (3) days of receipt of such notice shall constitute an
offense punishable by a fine of $100.00. Such notice shall continue in force and effect until full
compliance with the requirements stated therein and each and every failure to comply with such
notice within 24 hours after the 3 days allowed for compliance constitute a separate offense.

Section 3: That the Village Clerk is hereby authorized to publish this Ordinance in
pamphlet form.

Section 4: That this Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage,
approval and publication according to law.

VOTE: AYES: NAYS: ABSENT:

PASSED this day of 2019.

APPROVED this day of 2019.
APPROVED:

Mayor Craig B. Johnson
Village of Elk Grove Village
ATTEST:

Loretta M. Murphy, Village Clerk

PUBLISHED this day of 2019 in Pamphlet form.

45



RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION DETERMINING THE APPROPRIATENESS FOR CLASS 6B STATUS
PURSUANT TO THE COOK COUNTY REAL PROPERTY CLASSIFICATION
ORDINANCE AS AMENDED JULY 27, 2018 FOR CERTAIN REAL ESTATE LOCATED
AT 700 TOUHY AVENUE, ELK GROVE VILLAGE, ILLINOIS

WHEREAS, the Village of Elk Grove Village desires to promote the development of
industry in the Village of Elk Grove; and

WHEREAS, the Cook County Assessor is operating under an ordinance enacted by the
Cook County Board of Commissioners, and amended from time to time, the most recent
amendment becoming effective as of July 27, 2018, which has instituted a program to encourage
industrial and commercial development in Cook County known as the Cook County Real
Property Classification Ordinance; and

WHEREAS, in the case of abandoned property, if the municipality or the Mayor and Board
of Trustees, finds that special circumstances justify finding that the property is "abandoned" for
purpose of Class 6B, even though it has been vacant and unused for less than 24 months, that
finding, along with the specification of the circumstances, shall be included in the resolution or
ordinance supporting and consenting to the Class 6B application. Such resolution or ordinance
shall be filed with the eligibility application. If the ordinance or resolution is that of a
municipality, the approval of the Board of Commissioners of Cook County is required to validate
such shortened period of qualifying abandonment, and a resolution to that effect shall be
included with the Class 6B eligibility application filed with the Assessor; and

WHEREAS, the Petitioner has applied for or is applying for Class 6B property status
pursuant to said aforementioned ordinance for certain real estate located at 700 Touhy Avenue,
in the Village of Elk Grove Village, Cook County, Illinois, with the Property Index Number 08-
27-303-076-0000, and has proven to this Board that such incentive provided for in said
ordinance is necessary for development to occur on this specific real estate.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Board of Trustees of the
Village of Elk Grove Village, Counties of Cook and DuPage, Illinois:

Section 1: That the request of the Petitioner to have certain real estate located at 700 Touhy
Avenue, Elk Grove Village, Cook County, Illinois, identified by Property Index Number 08-27-
303-076-0000, declared eligible for Class 6B special circumstances status pursuant to the Cook
County Real Property Classification Ordinance as amended July 27, 2018, is hereby granted in
that this Board and the Village of ElIk Grove Village, Illinois, has determined that the incentive

1



provided by the said Class 6B Tax Incentive Ordinance is necessary for the said development to
occur on the subject property, legally described as follows:
LOT 1 IN VIRGINIA RESUBDIVISION OF LOT 402 IN CENTEX INDUSTRIAL
PARK UNIT 249, A SUBDIVISION IN SECTIONS 27 AND 34, TOWNSHIP 41
NORTH, RANGE 11, EAST OF THE THIRD PRINCIPAL MERIDIAN, IN COOK
COUNTY, ILLINOIS.

Section 2: That the Special Circumstances as outlined by the petitioner are attached hereto
as Exhibit "A" and made a part thereof.

Section 3: That the Village of ElIk Grove Village, Illinois hereby supports and consents to
the Class 6B Application and approves the classification of the subject property as Class 6B
property pursuant to the Cook County Real Property Classification Ordinance and the Class 6B
tax incentives shall apply to the property identified as Permanent Real Estate Index Number 08-
27-303-076-0000. Elk Grove Village is in receipt of an economic disclosure statement that is
required with the application packet.

Section 4: That the Mayor and Village Clerk are hereby authorized to sign any necessary
documents to implement this Resolution subject to the petitioner completing the following
conditions within twelve months of closing:

Interior buildout,

Sealcoat and stripe parking lot;

Reconstruct drive-in apron;

Removal of debris and update landscaping;

Installation of a new monument sign and building facade sign.

Pop o

Section 5: That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage

and approval according to law.

VOTE: AYES: _ NAYS: _ ABSENT:

PASSED this __ day of 20109.

APPROVED this _____ day of 20109.
APPROVED:

Mayor Craig B. Johnson
Village of Elk Grove Village
ATTEST:

Loretta M. Murphy, Village Clerk



Exhibit "A"

SARNOFF * BACCASH

P ROPERTY T A X L AW

Special circumstances requested by Benziger LLC
700 Touhy Ave., Elk Grove Village, lllinois (PIN: 08-27-303-076-0000)

Benziger LLC (“Applicant™) is requesting a Resolution in support and consent of a Class 6b
Incentive on the above-referenced property based on occupation of an abandoned property that has been
vacant for less than 24 continuous months with a purchase for value, special circumstances and substantial
rehabilitation. The Applicant plans to purchase the subject property and rehabilitate the same for its
related entity, Frank Cooney Co., Inc., to occupy for its operations consisting of the light assembly,
warehousing and distribution of educational furniture.

The subject property consists of an approximately 126,654 square foot site with a roughly 39,545
square foot building that has been 100% vacant and unused since March 4, 2019. The property is in need
of improvements. Therefore, the Applicant plans to spend approximately $48,000 to $53,500 to
immediately rehabilitate and improve the subject property. Based on initial inspections these
improvements will be to paint the interior, add new carpet, add new signage, update the landscaping,
sealcoat and stripe the parking lot, reconstruct the drive-in apron and clean up debris around the site as
well as to complete other general maintenance.

In addition, please note that all of the rehabilitation costs could significantly vary depending ona
variety of factors such as market variances. Further inspections of the subject property may require
additional improvements. The rehabilitation will create approximately 5 to 10 construction jobs.

Frank Cooney Co., Inc. currently leases approximately 17,000 square feet in Wood Dale, Illinois.
Frank Cooney Co., Inc. is growing and needs to expand its operations, and therefore, plans to move its
entire operation to the subject property. As a result, Frank Cooney Co., Inc. plans to bring all 29 of its
employees (25 full-time; 4 part-time) to the subject property and plans to hire an additional 2 to 4
employees initially and another 2 to 4 within the first three years of operations at the subject property.
Additionally, Frank Cooney Co., Inc. will look to hire all qualitied Elk Grove Village residents for future
hires.

Elk Grove Village can also expect that Frank Cooney Co., Inc. and its employees will invest
commercially back into the community by visiting local establishments such as restaurants, gas stations,
grocery stores and more. In addition, Elk Grove Village can expect that Frank Cooney Co., Inc. will
attract business and various customers to the Village in the course of its operations.

Based on our research and the additional costs that must be incurred to improve and rehabilitate
the building in order for this to be a successful endeavor, the Applicant must possess a Class 6b Incentive
to complete the improvements and to successfully operate the property. It is for these reasons that it is
necessary to grant the Applicant a Resolution in support and consent of a Class 6b Incentive for the
subject property based on occupation of an abandoned property that has been vacant for less than 24
continuous months with a purchase for value, special circumstances and substantial rehabilitation.




RESOLUTION NO.

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE MAYOR TO EXECUTE AN
INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT BETWEEN THE ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT
OF HEALTHCARE AND FAMILY SERVICES AND THE VILLAGE OF ELK GROVE
VILLAGE

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Mayor and Board of Trustees of the
Village of Elk Grove Village, Counties of Cook and DuPage, State of Illinois as follows:

Section 1: That the Mayor be and is hereby authorized to sign the attached document

marked:
INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT
BETWEEN
THE ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF HEALTHCARE AND FAMILY SERVICES
AND

THE VILLAGE OF ELK GROVE VILLAGE
a copy of which is attached hereto and made a part hereof as if fully set forth and the Village Clerk
Is authorized to attest said document upon the signature of the Mayor.
Section 2: That this Resolution shall be in full force and effect from and after its passage

and approval according to law.

VOTE: AYES: NAYS. ____ ABSENT:

PASSED this____day of 2019.

APPROVED this day of, 2019.
APPROVED:

Mayor Craig B. Johnson
Village of Elk Grove Village

ATTEST:

Loretta M. Murphy, Village Clerk



INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT
BETWEEN
THE ILLINOIS DEPARTMENT OF HEALTHCARE AND FAMILY SERVICES
AND
THE VILLAGE OF ELK GROVE VILLAGE
2020-20-

The Illinois Department of Healthcare and Family Services (HFS or the Department) and the Village of Elk
Grove Village, pursuant to the Intergovernmental Cooperation Act, 5 ILCS 220/1 et seq., hereby enter
into this Intergovernmental Agreement (Agreement) in connection with enhance rates for ambulance
services. HFS and the Village of Elk Grove Village are collectively referred to herein as “Parties” or
individually as a “Party.”

ARTICLE |
INTRODUCTION

1.01  Background. Article XlIl of the Illinois Public Aid Code authorizes the Illinois Department of
Healthcare and Family Services to make use of, aid and co-operate with State and local governmental
agencies and the Intergovernmental Cooperation Act, 5 ILCS 220/1 et seq. provides for cooperation
between units of government. Provider operates a Fire Department (Provider) that is enrolled in the
Medical Assistance Program that provides covered ambulance services to individuals eligible for benefits
under the Medical Programs; the costs of providing the services described above is not covered by the
fee schedule pursuant to which the Department and Managed Care Organizations (MCOs) pay for such
services.

1.02  Purpose. In order to provide greater cost coverage to Provider through enhanced rates for
services, the Parties enter into this Intergovernmental Agreement.

1.03 Definitions

(a) Covered Ambulance Services means all ambulance services reimbursable under the lllinois
Medicaid state plan and provided to beneficiaries of Medical Programs.

(b) Effective Federal Match Rate means the weighted average of the Federal Medical Assistance
Percentage (FMAP) for lllinois non-Affordable Care Act (ACA) enrollees and the enhanced FMAP
for ACA expansion population based on the percentage of specified covered services to the
different populations.

(c) Fee-for-service or FFS means the services under Medical Programs reimbursed to providers
directly by the Department and not through an MCO.

(d) Managed Care Program means services under the Medical Programs for which the Department
pays a capitated payment to MCOs to cover the cost of covered medical services.

(e) Managed Care Organization (MCQO) means an entity under contract with the Department
receiving capitated payments and at risk for providing reimbursement for enrollees.

(f) Medical Programs means programs administered by the Department under the lllinois Public Aid
Code (305 ILCS 5/5 et seq.), the Children’s Health Insurance Program Act (215 ILCS 106/1 et seq.)
and the Covering All Kids Health Insurance Act (215 ILCS 170/1 et seq.).




INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT

Page 2 of 5

(g) Participating Municipal Ambulance Provider means an ambulance provider owned by a
municipal corporation that has executed an Intergovernmental Agreement with the Department
with terms substantially identical to this Agreement.

(h) Specified Covered Ambulance Services means emergency and non-emergency Basic Life Support
and Advanced Life Support trips and does not include mileage or oxygen.

ARTICLE Il
INTERGOVERNMENTAL TRANSFER

2.01  Provider will transfer on a periodic basis to the Department an amount equal to 50% of the total
enhanced rates paid to Provider by the Department and all MCOs for the period.

2.02  For FFS payments, the Department will send a monthly invoice to Provider for the higher FFS
payments described in Article IIl.

2.03  For MCO payments, the transfer of 50% of the supplemental payment described in Article Il
shall be made within 14 days after the receipt of enhanced payments from the MCO.

ARTICLE I
ENHANCED RATES FOR SERVICES

3.01 Expenditures. The Department shall pay or cause MCOs to pay enhanced rates to Provider for
specified covered ambulance services pursuant to this Article lll in addition to payments made at the
Department’s published fee schedule.
3.02 The enhanced rate will be determined as follows:
a. The Department will establish classes of similar Participating Municipal Ambulance
Providers.
b. For each provider in the class, the Department will calculate an amount as follows using
data from each provider’s most recent cost report:
i. Provider’s total costs for covered ambulance services will be calculated based on
submittal of the Department’s approved cost report.
ii. Total fee schedule payments received for covered ambulance services by Provider will
be subtracted from costs to determine the cost coverage gap.
iii. The cost coverage gap will be divided by the number of Specified Covered Ambulance
Services to determine a per service add-on payment
3.03 For FFS claims, the Department will add the calculated add-on amount to Provider’s rate on the
FFS fee schedule and the enhanced rate will be paid with the original claim.
3.04  On a quarterly basis, using encounter data of paid claims from each MCO in the Managed Care
Program received by the Department during the quarter, the Department will identify the number of
Specified Covered Ambulance Services provided to each MCO’s enrollees by Provider multiplied by the
uniform add-on fee and cause each MCO to pay provider the amount so calculated.
3.05  If mutually agreed upon by the Department and all Participating Municipal Ambulance
Providers, the payment of enhanced rates may be moved from a quarterly basis to a monthly basis.



INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT

Page 3 of 5

ARTICLE IV
TERM

4.01 Term. This Agreement shall commence October 1, 2019, or as soon as federal approval is
received for the Directed Payments required by this Agreement and shall continue until otherwise
terminated by the Parties.

ARTICLE V
TERMINATION

5.01 Termination on Notice. This Agreement may be terminated by either Party for any or no reason
upon thirty (30) days’ prior written notice to the other Party.

5.02 Termination for Cause. In the event either Party breaches this Agreement and fails to cure such
breach within ten (10) days’ written notice thereof from the non-breaching Party, the non-breaching
Party may terminate this Agreement upon written notice to the breaching Party.

5.03 Availability of Appropriation; Sufficiency of Funds. This Agreement is contingent upon and
subject to the availability of sufficient funds. The Department may terminate or suspend this
Agreement, in whole or in part, without advance notice and without penalty or further payment being
required, if (i) sufficient funds for this Agreement have not been appropriated or otherwise made
available to the Department by the State or the Federal funding source, (ii) the Governor or the
Department reserves funds, or (iii) the Governor or the Department determines that funds will not or
may not be available for payment. The Department shall provide notice, in writing, to Provider of any
such funding failure and its election to terminate or suspend this Agreement as soon as practicable. Any
suspension or termination pursuant to this Section will be effective upon the date of the written notice
unless otherwise indicated.

ARTICLE VI
MISCELLANEOUS

6.01 Renewal. This Agreement may be renewed for additional periods by mutual consent of the
Parties, expressed in writing and signed by the Parties.

6.02 Amendments. This Agreement may be modified or amended at any time during its term by
mutual consent of the Parties, expressed in writing and signed by the Parties.

6.03  Applicable Law and Severability. This Agreement shall be governed in all respects by the laws of
the State of lllinois. If any provision of this Agreement shall be held or deemed to be or shall in fact be
inoperative or unenforceable as applied in any particular case in any jurisdiction or jurisdictions or in all
cases because it conflicts with any other provision or provisions hereof or any constitution, statute,
ordinance, rule of law or public policy, or for any reason, such circumstance shall not have the effect of
rendering any other provision or provisions contained herein invalid, inoperative or unenforceable to
any extent whatsoever. The invalidity of any one or more phrases, sentences, clauses, or sections
contained in this Agreement shall not affect the remaining portions of this Agreement or any part
thereof. In the event that this Agreement is determined to be invalid by a court of competent
jurisdiction, it shall be terminated immediately.




INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT

Page 4 of 5

6.04  Records Retention. The Parties shall maintain for a minimum of six (6) years from the later of
the date of final payment under this Agreement, or the expiration of this Agreement, adequate books,
records and supporting documents to comply with the lllinois State Records Act. If an audit, litigation or
other action involving the records is begun before the end of the six-year period, the records shall be
retained until all issues arising out of the action are resolved.

6.05 No Personal Liability. No member, official, director, employee or agent of either Party shall be
individually or personally liable in connection with this Agreement.

6.06  Assignment; Binding Effect. This Agreement, or any portion thereof, shall not be assigned by any
of the Parties without the prior written consent of the other Parties. This Agreement shall inure to the
benefit of and shall be binding upon the Parties and their respective successors and permitted assigns.

6.07 Precedence. In the event there is a conflict between this Agreement and any of the exhibits
hereto, this Agreement shall control. In the event there is a conflict between this Agreement and
relevant statute(s) or Administrative Rule(s), the relevant statute(s) or rule(s) shall control.

6.08 Entire Agreement. This Agreement constitutes the entire agreement between the Parties; no
promises, terms, or conditions not recited, incorporated or referenced herein, including prior
agreements or oral discussions, shall be binding upon either Party.

6.09  Notices. All written notices, requests and communications may be made by electronic mail to
the e-mail addresses set forth below.

To HFS: Mary.Doran@illinois.gov
Kiran.Mehta@illinois.gov

To Village of Elk Grove Village: RMikel@elkgrove.org

6.10 Headings. Section and other headings contained in this Agreement are for reference purposes
only and are not intended to describe, interpret, define or limit the scope, extent or intent of this
Agreement or any provision hereof.

6.11  Counterparts. This Agreement may be executed in one or more counterparts, each of which
shall be considered to be one and the same agreement, binding on all Parties hereto, notwithstanding
that all Parties are not signatories to the same counterpart. Duplicated signatures, signatures
transmitted via facsimile, or signatures contained in a Portable Document Format (PDF) document shall
be deemed original for all purposes.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the Parties hereto have caused this Agreement to be executed by their duly
authorized representatives.


mailto:Mary.Doran@illinois.gov
mailto:Kiran.Mehta@illinois.gov
mailto:RMikel@elkgrove.org

INTERGOVERNMENTAL AGREEMENT

Page 5 of 5

THE VILLAGE OF ELK GROVE VILLAGE ILLINIOIS DEPARTMENT OF HEALTHCARE AND
FAMILY SERVICES

Craig B. Johnson Theresa Eagleson
Mayor Director
Date: Date:




	1. CALL TO ORDER
	2. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
	 INVOCATION
	3. APPROVAL OF MINUTES OF
	4. MAYOR & BOARD OF TRUSTEES' REPORT
	5. ACCOUNTS PAYABLE WARRANT:
	6. CONSENT AGENDA
	a. Consideration of a request from Saint Julian Eymar
	Memorandum Report
	Saint Julian Eymard Catholic Church Waiver Request

	b. Consideration of a request from First Baptist Chur
	Memorandum Report
	First Baptist Church of Elk Grove Village Waiver Request - 590 Tonne Road

	c. Consideration of a request from the Elk Grove Park
	Memorandum Report
	Elk Grove Park District Waiver Request - 225 E Elk Grove Blvd

	d. Concur with prior Village Board authorization to g
	Memorandum 
	QRLiquor,10-1-19

	e. Consideration to award funding for workforce devel
	Memorandum Report
	Elk Grove Village Gift Agreement

	f. Consideration to award a purchase contract through
	Winter 2019/2020 Bulk Rock Salt Purchase

	g. Consideration to accept the Comprehensive Annual F
	h. Consideration of a request to hold a Public Hearin
	i. Consideration to hold the regular Village Board Me
	2020 Schedule for Village Board Meetings

	j. Consideration to adopt Ordinance No. 3636 (attache
	Memorandum Report
	Ordinance

	k. Consideration to adopt Resolution No. 62-19 author
	Memorandum Report
	Resolution
	700 Touhy 6B Application

	l. Consideration to adopt Resolution No. 63-19 author
	Memorandum Report
	Resolution w/Agreement


	7. REGULAR AGENDA
	a. Consideration to approve sign variations for Love'
	Memorandum Report
	Loves Sign Package- 1900 Busse Road
	IL_Elk Grove - Sign Letter


	8. PLAN COMMISSION
	a. PC Docket 19-11 - A Public Hearing for a Special U
	b. Request granted for a Public Hearing to consider T

	9. ZONING BOARD OF APPEALS
	a. ZBA Docket 19-5 - A Public Hearing for a variation

	10. YOUTH COMMITTEE 
	11. BUSINESS LEADERS FORUMS
	12. CABLE TELEVISION COMMITTEE
	13. HEALTH & COMMUNITY SERVICES
	14. INFORMATION COMMITTEE
	15. RECYCLING & WASTE COMMITTEE
	16. PARADE COMMITTEE
	17. PERSONNEL COMMITTEE
	18. JUDICIARY, PLANNING AND ZONING COMMITTEE
	a. Telecommunication Facilities

	19. CAPITAL IMPROVEMENTS COMMITTEE
	20. AIRPORT UPDATE
	21. MID-SUMMER CLASSICS CONCERT SERIES UPDATE
	22. SPECIAL EVENTS COMMITTEE
	23. LIQUOR COMMISSION
	24. REPORT FROM VILLAGE MANAGER
	25. REPORT FROM VILLAGE CLERK
	26. UNFINISHED BUSINESS
	27. NEW BUSINESS
	28. PUBLIC COMMENT
	29. ADJOURNMENT



